

Nicole Carter
Procurement Specialist
NCARTER@TEAMHCSO.COM

Office: (813) 247-8053
Fax: (813) 247-1826

P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601
teamHCSO.com



Renewal 1 of 3



TC NUMBER: 2024-015

Window Films

Opened: July 18, 2024 3:00pm EST
Initial Award: 8/14/2024 - 8/13/2026
Change Order #: NULL

Auto Renewal 1 EXP: 8/13/2028

Auto Renewal 2 EXP: 8/13/2030

Auto Renewal 3 EXP: 8/13/2032

Terms: Two (2) Year Initial Award

Optional: Three (3) Bi-Annual Renewals

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD		Solar Gard Magnum*		Madico*		Clear-Armor Security Products*		3M*		Llumar*	
AUTHORIZED						Avery Dennison*					
Vehicle Tints											
A.1	Sedan New Installation	\$145.00	2 HR	\$300.00	2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
A.2	Sedan Windshield Strip	\$30.00	1 HR	\$75.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
A.3	Sedan Front Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$75.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
A.4	Sedan Rear Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$75.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
A.5	Sedan Back Window	\$90.00	1 HR	\$150.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
B.1	Truck New Installation	\$145.00	2 HR	\$350.00	2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
B.2	Truck Windshield Strip	\$30.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
B.3	Truck Front Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
B.4	Truck Rear Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
B.5	Truck Back Window	\$90.00	1 HR	\$150.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
C.1	SUV New Installation	\$180.00	3 HR	\$450.00	3 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
C.2	SUV Windshield Strip	\$30.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
C.3	SUV Front Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
C.4	SUV Rear Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
C.5	SUV Back Window	\$90.00	1 HR	\$150.00	1 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
AVG											
D.1	Van New Installation	\$180.00	3 HR	\$300.00 (Fewer Windows Model) \$900.00 (More Windows Model)	2-6 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
D.2	Van Windshield Strip	\$30.00	1 HR	\$100.00	1-2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
D.3	Van Front Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00 for <19" Windows \$200.00 for >20" Windows	1-2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
D.4	Van Rear Side Window	\$40.00	1 HR	\$100.00 for <19" Windows \$200.00 for >20" Windows	1-2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
D.5	Van Back Window	\$90.00	1 HR	\$100.00 for <19" Windows \$200.00 for >20" Windows	1-2 HR	No Bid	-	No Bid	-	No Bid	
Architectural Films			LEAD		LEAD		LEAD		LEAD		
E.1	Mirrored/Reflective per square foot	Solar Gard - Silver \$7.50	2-3 Day	→Architectural Window Films \$10.00	2 Days	Avery Dennison Products \$12.00	30 Days	3M - One Way Mirror \$6.55	21-28 Days	Llumar - Silver 20 \$10.00	
E.2	Safety & Security per square foot	Solar Gard - ARMORCOAT \$10.50 - (4 mil) \$16.50 - (8 mil)	2-3 Day	(4 mil) clear \$10 (7 mil) clear \$14 (8 mil) clear \$15 (14 mil) clear \$20	2 Days	Clear-Armor SL 15 (15 mil) \$32.00 Clear-Armor SL31 (31 mil) \$52.00	30 Days	3M - Ultra S800 (8 Mil) \$11.25	21-28 Days	Llumar - Clear (8 mil) \$13.00	
E.3	Privacy/Frosted per square foot	Solar Gard - Clear Frost \$8.50	2-3 Day	→Architectural Window Films \$10.00	2 Days	Avery Dennison Products \$13.00	30 Days	3M - Fasara Milky White Milano \$6.45	21-28 Days	Llumar - Frost \$13.00	
F	Cling Films - Installed per square foot	Solar Gard - No Adhesive/Plexiglass \$8.50	2-3 Day	No Bid	-	Avery Dennison Products \$12.00	30 Days	3M - Anti-Graffiti (4 mil) \$6.15	21-28 Days	No Bid	
•	Notes			→ See Buyer for Architectural Window Films List		→ See Buyer for Avery Dennison Films List					
•	Exceptions	Left Blank		Left Blank		N/A		Excludes vehicle films		\$750 minimum install per day	

Nicole Carter
Procurement Specialist
NCARTER@TEAMHCSO.COM

Office: (813) 247-8053
Fax: (813) 247-1826

P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601
teamHCSO.com



Renewal 1 of 3



TC NUMBER: 2024-015

Window Films

Opened: July 18, 2024 3:00pm EST

Initial Award: 8/14/2024 - 8/13/2026

Change Order #: NULL

Auto Renewal 1 EXP: 8/13/2028

Auto Renewal 2 EXP: 8/13/2030

Auto Renewal 3 EXP: 8/13/2032

Terms: Two (2) Year Initial Award

Optional: Three (3) Bi-Annual Renewals

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

AUTHORIZED

Vehicle Tints		
A.1	Sedan New Installation	-
A.2	Sedan Windshield Strip	-
A.3	Sedan Front Side Window	-
A.4	Sedan Rear Side Window	-
A.5	Sedan Back Window	-
B.1	Truck New Installation	-
B.2	Truck Windshield Strip	-
B.3	Truck Front Side Window	-
B.4	Truck Rear Side Window	-
B.5	Truck Back Window	-
C.1	SUV New Installation	-
C.2	SUV Windshield Strip	-
C.3	SUV Front Side Window	-
C.4	SUV Rear Side Window	-
C.5	SUV Back Window	-
D.1	Van New Installation	-
D.2	Van Windshield Strip	-
D.3	Van Front Side Window	-
D.4	Van Rear Side Window	-
D.5	Van Back Window	-
Architectural Films		LEAD
E.1	Mirrored/Reflective per square foot	14 Days
E.2	Safety & Security per square foot	14 Days
E.3	Privacy/Frosted per square foot	14 Days
F	Cling Films - Installed per square foot	-
•	Notes	
•	Exceptions	