=== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

Page 1 of 5

SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 East B Aveviz
Tuses, FL35605
Bid Tabulation CO# 5
Renewal 2 of 3

BryAN CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
Bovex ORIENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(512) 247-506§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.com

BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 S1-256337 SI-300908 S1-254386

Opened: January 2, 2024 Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.

Awarded|Monday, February 12, 2024
Initial Term Expires: February 12, 2025
1: June 12, 2024

October 21, 2025
Change Order#5: December 23, 2025
Renewal 1 Expires: February 11, 2026
Renewal 2 Expires: February 11, 2027
Renewal 3 Expires:

18530 Mack Ave
Grosse Pointe Farms, MI. 48236

Matthew Bell

3810 W. Osborne Ave.
Tampa, FL. 33614

Kevin Brennan

701 Columbia Blvd.
Titusville, FL. 32780

Orlando Rioseco

1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100
Pflugerville, TX. 78660

David Curtis

20701 Nordhoff Street

Chatsworth, CA.

91311

Ameer Nouh

1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Lexington, KY. 40505

John Perkins

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 818-341-1500 844-464-2557

Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@copsplus.com kbrennan(@danasafety.com orioseco@lawmens.net formw.com perkins ), om

(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPITION BNV Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price

1 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 26 00290 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $54.50
2 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 28 00291 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
3 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 30 00292 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
4 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 32 00293 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
5 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 34 00294 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
6 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 36 00295 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
7 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 38 00296 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
8 | Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 40 00297 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $54.50
9  |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 42 00298 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
10 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 44 00299 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
11 [Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 46 00300 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $55.13
12 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 48 00301 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $54.50
13 [Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 50 00302 $86.58 $65.97 $97.40 No Bid No Bid $62.48
14 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 52 00303 $86.58 $65.97 $97.40 No Bid No Bid $62.48
15 [Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 54 00304 $86.58 $65.97 $99.80 No Bid No Bid $62.48
16  [Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 56 00305 $86.58 $68.97 $99.80 No Bid No Bid $70.88
17 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 58 00306 $86.58 $68.97 $106.50 No Bid No Bid $70.47
18  [Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 60 00307 $86.58 $68.97 $106.50 No Bid No Bid $70.47
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=== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 East B AvENiE

Page 2 of 5

Tuses, FL35605
Bid Tabulation CO# 5
Renewal 2 of 3
BryAN CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
Bovex ORIENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(512) 247-506§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.com
BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 S1-256337 SI-300908 S1-254386
Opened: January 2, 2024 Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.

Awarded|Monday, February 12, 2024

18530 Mack Ave

3810 W. Osborne Ave.

701 Columbia Blvd.

1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100

20701 Nordhoff

Street

1340 Russell Cave Rd.

Initial Term Expires: February 12, 2025 Grosse Pointe Farms, MI. 48236 Tampa, FL. 33614 Titusville, FL. 32780 Pflugerville, TX. 78660 Chatsworth, CA. 91311 Lexington, KY. 40505
Change Order# 1: June 12, 2024
Change Order# 2: July 18, 2024
Change Order# 3: August 26, 2025
Change Ord October 21, 2025
Change Ord December 23, 2025
Renewal 1 Expires: February 11, 2026
Renewal 2 Expires: February 11, 2027 Matthew Bell Kevin Brennan Orlando Rioseco David Curtis Ameer Nouh John Perkins
Renewal 3 Expires:
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 512-451-8298 818-341-1500 844-464-2557
Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@copsplus.com kbrennan(@danasafety.com orioseco@lawmens.net .com perkins ), om
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
DESCRIPITION Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
19 | ASP Baton Holder Sidebreak - Rotating Scabbard 21-Black 00087 $42.71 $47.31 $37.20 $40.91 $54.50 $47.25
20 |Bianchi Model 7906 P/N 22091 Basketweave BeltKeepers (4-Pk) 00289 $11.31 No Bid $11.52 $12.05 No Bid No Bid
21 |Eleven 10 Model E10-3021B-BSK Basketweave C-A-T Tourniquet Holder - Black 00667 $26.99 $26.99 $32.75 $32.89 $38.50 29.25
22 |Bianchi Model 7900 P/N 22063 Basketweave CuffCase 00308 $23.34 No Bid $23.77 $24.85 No Bid No Bid
23 |Bianchi Model 7902 P/N 25341 Basketweave Double Mag Case 00313 $29.93 No Bid $30.48 $31.87 No Bid No Bid
24 |306-Open Top Mini-Flashlight Holder 00084 $11.29 $30.25 No Bid No Bid $15.50 12.82
25 |Bianchi Model 7928 P/N 22962 Basketweave 00309 $17.62 No Bid $17.91 $18.76 No Bid No Bid
Glove Case
2% Biachi Model 7907 P/N 22103 Basketweave OC 00310 $22.77 No Bid $23.18 $24.24 No Bid No Bid
Foam Holder
Streamlight Compact Tactical Weapon-Mounted
27 Light TLR-7A Flex 00913 $128.50 $110.75 $119.00 $121.20 $152.50 $125.93
28 |Safariland Model 763-4 Basketweave Radio Carrier 00086 $24.92 No Bid $25.39 $26.52 No Bid No Bid
29 |Defensive Baton - ASP Baton F21EF #52413 00017 $123.91 $119.86 $120.00 $118.69 $149.50 $111.51
30  |Handcuffs (Peerless Model #700) 00078 $23.57 $27.25 $24.75 $24.88 $28.50 $24.75
31  |[Safariland Model 62-4-9HS Hi Gloss Belt Keepers(4-Pk) 00361 $23.78 No Bid $24.22 $25.30 No Bid No Bid
32 |Safariland Model 190-9HS Hi Gloss Cuff Case 00362 $34.36 No Bid $35.62 36.59 No Bid No Bid
33 |Safariland Model 77-76-9HS Hi Gloss Double Mag Case 00374 $34.93 No Bid 36.31 $37.20 No Bid No Bid
34 |Safariland Model 763-9 Hi Gloss Radio Carrier 00360 $29.50 No Bid $30.21 $31.40 No Bid No Bid
35 |Safariland Model 33-9V Hi Gloss Glove Case 00359 $24.19 No Bid $24.65 $25.76 No Bid No Bid
36 [Safariland Model 38-4-9HS Hi Gloss OC FoamHolder 00363 $29.50 No Bid $30.21 $31.40 No Bid No Bid
37 |LawPro Sam Browne Belt Buckle - Gold 00489 $6.33 $6.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.30
38  |Leg Irons (Peerless Model #703C) 00130 $44.94 $49.50 $43.57 $45.85 $50.50 $45.60
39  |OC Pepper Gel - Sabre Red Crossfire MK-3 Gel 00284 $10.24 $10.90 $14.00 No Bid $15.50 $15.27
40  |Plastic Flex Cuffs - Monadnock #8220-3-2B Black 00318 $178.94 Per 100 No Bid $186.56 $198.41 Case No Bid $225.75 Case
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== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

Page 3 of 5

SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 Exsr. o
Luiea, L3500
Bid Tabulation CO# 5
Renewal 2 of 3

Bryan CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
BoveR ORENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(512) 247-506§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.coMm

BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 S1-256337 SI-300908 S1-254386

Opened: January 2, 2024 Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.

Awarded|Monday, February 12, 2024
Initial Term Expires: February 12, 2025
Change Order# 1: June 12, 2024

Change Order# 2: July 18, 2024

Change Order# 3: August 26, 2025
Change Order#4: October 21, 2025
Change Order#5: December 23, 2025
Renewal 1 Expires: February 11, 2026
Renewal 2 Expires: February 11, 2027
Renewal 3 Expires:

18530 Mack Ave
Grosse Pointe Farms, MI. 48236

Matthew Bell

3810 W. Osborne Ave.
Tampa, FL. 33614

Kevin Brennan

701 Columbia Blvd.
Titusville, FL. 32780

Orlando Rioseco

1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100
Pflugerville, TX. 78660

David Curtis

20701 Nordhoff Street
Chatsworth, CA. 91311

Ameer Nouh

1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Lexington, KY. 40505

John Perkins

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 512-451-8298 818-341-1500 844-464-2557
Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@copsplus.com kbrennan(@danasafety.com orioseco@lawmens.net txbids@gtdist.com bid: formw.com perkins ), om
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
DESCRIPITION Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
Quick Release Holster System . . .
41 Safariland Quick-Kit 1 (QLS 19 & QLS 22) Black 00639 $20.65 No Bid $37.45 $20.73 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7378-28327-412; Safariland 7378 7TS
42 |ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Combo, Plain Black, Glock 45, TLR-7, LH 00762 $48.67 No Bid $49.56 $51.83 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7378-28327-411; Safariland 7378 7TS
43 |ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Combo, Plain Black, Glock 45, TLR-7, RH 00761 $48.67 No Bid $49.56 $51.83 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-412; Safariland 7360 7TS
44 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, LH 00782 $126.14 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-482; Safariland 7360 7TS
45 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, LH 00760 $126.14 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-492; Safariland 7360 7TS
46 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Hi Gloss, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, LH 00771 $140.98 No Bid $142.75 $140.18 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-411; Safariland 7360 7TS
47 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, RH 00781 $126.14 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-481; Safariland 7360 7TS
48 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, RH 00759 $126.14 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360-28327-491; Safariland 7360 7TS
49 |ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Hi Gloss, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR-7, RH 00770 $140.98 No Bid $142.75 $140.18 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-481; Safariland New It
50 [7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR- ;;‘12;'" $140.65 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
7, RH
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-482; Safariland NewI
51 |7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR- :)‘;l}t!e)m $140.65 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
7,LH
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-411; Safariland New It
52 |7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, RH ;VZ”U:'" $140.65 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-412; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain New It
53 |Black, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, LH Pores $140.65 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-491; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black New Item
54 |Hi- Gloss, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, RH 02135 $155.49 No Bid $157.20 $154.60 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-492; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black | New Item X X .
55 |Hi- Gloss, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, LH 02136 $155.49 No Bid $157.20 $154.60 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7378RDS-28327-412; Safariland New Item
56 |7378RDS 7TS ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Combo, Plain Black, Glock | 02133-RH, $83.61 No Bid $84.96 $88.87 No Bid No Bid
45MOS, 509-T, 02134-LH
57 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 26 New Item $45.15
58 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 28 New Item $45.15
59 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 30 New Item $45.15
60  |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 32 New Item $45.15
61 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 34 New Item $45.15



mailto:mattb@copsplus.com
mailto:kbrennan@danasafety.com
mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
mailto:txbids@gtdist.com
mailto:bids@uniformw.com
mailto:perkins-john@galls.com

=== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY Page 4 of 5
SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 East B AvENiE
Lusea, FL 35000

Bid Tabulation CO# 5

Renewal 2 of 3
BryAN CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
BoveR ORENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(512) 247-506§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.com
BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 56337 SI-300908 S1-254386
Opened: January 2, 2024 Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.
Awarded|Monday, February 12, 2024 18530 Mack Ave 3810 W. Osborne Ave. 701 Columbia Blvd. 1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100 20701 Nordhoff Street 1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Initial Term Expires: February 12, 2025 Grosse Pointe Farms, MI. 48236 Tampa, FL. 33614 Titusville, FL. 32780 Pflugerville, TX. 78660 Chatsworth, CA. 91311 Lexington, KY. 40505
Change Order# 1: June 12, 2024
Change Order# 2: July 18, 2024
Change Order# 3: August 26, 2025
Change Order#4: October 21, 2025
Change Order#5: December 23, 2025
Renewal 1 Expires: February 11, 2026
Renewal 2 Expires: February 11, 2027 Matthew Bell Kevin Brennan Orlando Rioseco David Curtis Ameer Nouh John Perkins
Renewal 3 Expires:
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 512-451-8298 818-341-1500 844-464-2557
Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@copsplus.com kbrennan(@danasafety.com orioseco@lawmens.net txbids@gtdist.com bid: formw.com perkins ), om
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
DESCRIPITION Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
62 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 36 New Item $45.15
63  |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 38 New Item $45.15
64  |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 40 New Item $45.15
65 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 42 New Item $45.15
66 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 44 New Item $45.15
67 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 46 New Item $45.15
68 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 48 New Item $45.15
69  |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 50 New Item $45.15
70 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 52 New Item $45.15
71 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 54 New Item $45.15
72 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 56 New Item $45.15
73  |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 58 New Item $45.15
74 |Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 60 New Item $45.15
75 |ASP Sentry Chain Handcuffs New Item $31.66 $33.92 Item# 24956, MPN 56100 $40.00
76  |Bianchi 7900 Covered ASP Handcuff Case New Item No Bid $29.63 Item# 20168, MPN# 23101 $38.00



mailto:mattb@copsplus.com
mailto:kbrennan@danasafety.com
mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
mailto:txbids@gtdist.com
mailto:bids@uniformw.com
mailto:perkins-john@galls.com

== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

Page 5 of 5

SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 Exsr. o
Luiea, L3500
Bid Tabulation CO# 5
Renewal 2 of 3
Bryan CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
BoveR ORENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(512) 247-506§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.coMm
BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 S1-256337 SI-300908 S1-254386
Opened: January 2, 2024 Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.
Awarded|Monday, February 12, 2024 18530 Mack Ave 3810 W. Osborne Ave. 701 Columbia Blvd. 1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100 20701 Nordhoff Street 1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Initial Term Expires: February 12, 2025 Grosse Pointe Farms, MI. 48236 Tampa, FL. 33614 Titusville, FL. 32780 Pflugerville, TX. 78660 Chatsworth, CA. 91311 Lexington, KY. 40505
Change Order# 1: June 12, 2024
Change Order# 2: July 18, 2024
Change Order# 3: August 26, 2025
Change Ord October 21, 2025
Change Ord December 23, 2025
Renewal 1 Expires: February 11, 2026
Renewal 2 Expires: February 11, 2027 Matthew Bell Kevin Brennan Orlando Rioseco David Curtis Ameer Nouh John Perkins
Renewal 3 Expires:
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 512-451-8298 818-341-1500 844-464-2557
Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@copsplus.com kbrennan(@danasafety.com orioseco@lawmens.net txbids@gtdist.com bid: formw.com perkins ), om
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
DESCRIPITION Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
77 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-28 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
78 | Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-30 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
79 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-32 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
80| Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-34 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
81 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-36 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
2 N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
82| Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-38 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
83 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-40 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
4 N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
84 | Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-42 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
85 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-44 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
86 | Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-46 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
87 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-48 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
N New It . 39.00 46.80 No Bid 51.90 .
88 | Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-50 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . X 46. No B: il .
89 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-52 ew Item $38.00 $39.00 $46.80 o Bid $51.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
9 N New It . 42.00 50.35 No Bid 55.90 .
0 | Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-54 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
v New Itel . 42. L No B: Y .
91 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-56 ew Item $38.00 $42.00 $50.35 o Bid $55.90 $38.00
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black 3
92 N New It . 42.00 52.75 No Bid 55.90 .
Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-58 ew ttem S800 8 8 ot 8 380
Hero's Pride 1230 AirTek Sam Browne Deluxe 2.25" Duty Belt- Basketweave Black q
' New Ites . 42 2. No B: b .
93 Buckle Type: Nickel SKU: 1230WX-2-62 ew Item $38.00 $42.00 $52.75 o Bid $55.90 $38.00
q 19.50ea (Black, Navy, Ranger
$12.45ea $17.98ea North American Rescue ZZ-0661 q $14.90ea
94 v N b v C-A- New It 13.49 No Bid b
Eleven 10 RIGID TQ Case Jacket v2 for C-A-T ew Item $ SKU: E10-7021-BLK RIGID TQ Case Cover o Bi Green, Co.y.ote) SKU: FA1120 BLK
$21.50 (MuitilCam)
Delivery Days 45-60 Days 30-60 Days 30-60 Days 60 Days 20 Days 30 Days
Exceptions No Min Order No Min Order No Min Order
Change Order#1 Added Gall's Brand Sam Brown Duty Belt
Change Order#2 Added 306- Open Top Flashlight Holder
Change Order#3 Added ASP Sentry Handeuff and Bianchi 7900 Covered ASP Handeuff Case
Chandge Order#4 Added Hero's Pride AirTek Sam Browne Duty Belt
Chandge Order#S Added Eleven 10 RIGID TQ Case Jacket
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