CHAD CHRONISTER, SHERIFF

7 HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE

BID TABULATION - page 1 of 4

Donna Farnham, Warehouse Manager

Supply Distribution Bureau
(813) 247-8948

[BID NUMBER:
Lawmen's & Shooters’
Bid 9-19 Duty Gear GT Distributors, Inc. Supply Dana Safety
2545 Brockton Drive
Opened: July 16, 2019 Ste 100 7750 9th Street SW 3810-A W. Hillsborough Ave
Awarded: July 30, 2019 Austin, TX 78758 Vero Beach, FL 32968 Tampa, FL 33614
1st Renewal Exp: July 29, 2021 Ph: 800-252-8310 Ph: 800-562-5697 Ph: 813-348-4866
2nd Renewal Exp: July 28, 2022 Fx: 800-480-5845 Fx: 772-569-2955 Fx: 813-375-8347
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award Sandi White Gail Walker-Keen Mark Sevigny
Three (3) Annual Renewals sandi.white@gatdist.com gail@lawmans.net msevigny@1dss.com
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD)
L DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: BASKET WEAVE
Number p i .
ASP BATON HOLDER ) - $20.265
10212 | \op F221 SIDEBREAK 2432 $31.74 $34.62/ min 5
BIW BELT KEEPERS (4-PACK)
10884 | g ANCHI® ACCUMOLD ELITE 22091 $9.76 NOBID NOBID
B/W CUFF CASE
10903 |5 ANCHI® ACCUMOLD ELITE 22063 $21.77 NOBID NOBID
B/W GLOVE CASE
10904 | g ANCHI® ACCUMOLD ELITE 22962 L2 NO BID NOBID
B/W OC FOAM HOLSTER
10921 |5 ANCHI® ACCUMOLD ELITE 22103 $21.19 NO BID NO BID
BIW MAG CASE DOULE STACK .40 call@mm
10924 |5 ANCHI® ACCUMOLD ELITE 22079 SIZE 02 $28.53 NO BID NO BID
——1B/W DUTY BELT 2-1/4°, UNLINED, SIZES 25-54 Y
Various GALLS LP145 Sl : NO BID NOBID NOBID
TASER HOLSTER RH
11400 oA ARILAND® 6520 STX BW 364-481 RH $65.38 NOBID NOBIB
TASER HOLSTER LH
11401 |SAFARILAND® 6520 STX BW 364-482 LH $65.38 NOBID NO BID
HOLSTER for Glock 45 9mm pistol, Vertical Belt Loop
11868  |SAFARILAND® W/ LIGHT: RH 7360-28327-481- $130,69 NOBID NO BID
HOLSTER for Glock 45 9mm pistol, Vertical Belt Loop
11869 |SAFARILAND® W/ LIGHT: LH 7360-28327-482- $130.59 NOBID NO BID
B/W TOURNIQUET HOLDER
11766 | AR G7 CAT RIGID TQ 800560 §31.73 el $29.25
TASER X26 HOLSTER - RH $35.45/ min of 5 any $33.45
11286 |5 ADE TECH X26 $35.28 combo
TASER X26 HOLSTER - LH $35.45/ min of 5 any $33.45
11287 |5y ADE TECH X26 $35.28 combo
TASER X26P HOLSTER - RH $35.45/ min of 5 any $33.45
11401 5| ADE TECH X26P e combo
TASER X26P HOLSTER - LH $35.45 / min of 5 any $3345
11400 |5 ADE TECH X26P S combo
B/W TASER HOLSTER 775 - RH
New Item | <) EARILAND SAF-7520-364-411 $66.00 HO SID NO BID
B/W TASER HOLSTER 77S - LH
New Item |\ FARILAND SAF-7520-364-412 $66.00 NOBID NOBID
PLAIN TASER HOLSTER 7TS - RH
New Item |5 ARILAND SAF-7520-364-411 $66.00 HOBI0 NOBID
PLAIN TASER HOLSTER 775 - LH
'=Ne‘” ltem | AFARILAND SAF-7520-364-412 $66.00 NO BID NOBID
Time for Delivery ARO 60 Days 30-45 Days 30 Days
Exceptions None None None
* BW Duty Belt - No Award Buyer Rev 8.18.20 (pg 4)

* CO#1 - Dana Safety non-renewed on the 1st renewal, awarded to GT, with the addition of new Taser Holster awarded to GT 7/14/2020



Donna Farnham, Warehouse Manager
Supply Distribution Bureau
(813) 247-8948
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|BID NUMBER: -

Bid 9-19 Duty Gear GT Distributors, Inc. | awmen's & Shooters Suppl Dana Safety
Opened: July 16, 2019 2545 Brockton Drive Ste 100 7750 9th Street SW Non Renewal
Awarded: July 30, 2019 Austin, TX 78758 Vero Beach, FL 32968
1st Renewal Exp: July 29, 2021 Ph: 800-252-8310 Ph: 800-562-5697 Non Renewal
2nd Renewal Exp: July 29, 2022 Fx: 800-480-5845 Fx: 772-569-2955
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award Sandi White Gail Walker-Keen
Three (3) Annual Renewals sandi.white@atdist.com gail@lawmans.net
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

jeai DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: NYLON
Number ol
NYLON OC FOAM HOLDER $9.22
10932 | )NCLE MIKE'S KODRA 8877-1 $12.53 $10.21
NYLON BELT KEEPERS (4-PACK) $7.06
11049 |\;NGLE MIKE'S NYLON WEB 8865-1 $9.71 §7.99
NYLON MAG CASE DOUBLE $43.70
11052 | )NCLE MIKE'S KODRA 8836-1 $14.72 $14.54
NYLON GLOVE CASE $6.15
11054 | NCLE MIKE'S KODRA 8887-1 $9.20 $8.54
NYLON WEB BELT - INNER SMALL 26-30
11036 | yNGLE MIKE'S ULTRA INNER DUTY 8781-1 $10.92 $12.87 $13:26
NYLON WEB BELT - INNER MEDIUM 32-36
11037 | yNCLE MIKE'S ULTRA INNER DUTY 8782-1 $12.91 $13.79 $13.25
NYLON WEB BELT - INNER LARGE 38-42
11038 | yNCLE MIKE'S ULTRA INNER DUTY 8783-1 $12.91 i $13.25
NYLON WEB BELT - INNER 1XL 44-48
11039 | )NCLE MIKE'S ULTRA INNER DUTY 8784-1 $12.91 e $13.25
NYLON WEB BELT - INNER 2XL 50-54
11040 | ,NCLE MIKE'S ULTRA INNER DUTY 8784-2 $12.91 $13.79 $16.59
NYLON WEB BELT - OUTER SMALL 26-30 $16.59
11043 | yNCLE MIKE'S WEB ULTRA DUTY 8776-1 $19.87 $17.24
NYLON WEB BELT - OUTER MEDIUM 32-36 $16.69
11044 | ;NCLE MIKE'S WEB ULTRA DUTY 8777-1 L $17.24
NYLON WEB BELT - OUTER LARGE 38-42 $16.69
11045 | /NCLE MIKE'S WEB ULTRA DUTY 87781 $19.67 $17.24
NYLON WEB BELT - OUTER 1XL 44-48 $16.69
11046 | ,NCLE MIKE'S WEB ULTRA DUTY 8779-1 $23.18 $17.24
NYLON WEB BELT - OUTER 2XL 50-54 $16.60
11047 | JNCLE MIKE'S WEB ULTRA DUTY 8779-2 $23.18 $17.24
Holster - Glock 45/9mm pistol, Plain Black, Vertical Belt Lp
11892 |SAFARILAND® WITH LIGHT - RH 7360-28327-411-MS30 (ivl 3) $130.59 NOBID NO BID
Holster - Glock 45/8mm pistol, Plain Black, Vertical Belt Lp
11893 |5 AFARILAND® WITH LIGHT - LH 7360-28327-412-MS30 (vl 3) $130.59 NOBID NO BID
Holster - Glock 45/9mm pistol, Plain Black, Vertical Belt Lp
11716 |SAFARILAND® NO LIGHT - RH 7360-2835-411-MS30 s HOBID NS BID
Holster - Glock 45/9mm pistol, Plain Black, Vertical Belt Lp
11717 |SAFARILAND® NO LIGHT - LH 7360-2835-412-MS30 $121.08 NO BID HO EIR
Time for Delivery ARO 60 Days 30-45 Days 30 Days
* BW Duty Belt - No Award Buyer Rev 8.18.20 (pg 4)

* CO#1 - Dana Safety non-renewed on the 1st renewal, awarded to GT, with the addition of new Taser Holster awarded to GT 7/14/2020



Donna Farnham, Warehouse Manager
Supply Distribution Bureau
(813) 247-8948

” HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

CHAD CHRONISTER, SHERIFF

\ SHERIFF’S OFFICE

BID TABULATION - page 3 of 4

BID NUMBER:

Bid 9-19 Duty Gear

Opened: July 16, 2019
Awarded: July 30, 2019

1st Renewal Exp: July 29, 2021
2nd Renewal Exp: July 29, 2022

GT Distributors, Inc.
2545 Brockton Drive Ste 100
Austin, TX 78758
Ph: 800-252-8310
Fx: 800-480-5845

Lawmen's & Shooters Supply
7750 9th Street SW
Vero Beach, FL 32968
Ph: 800-562-5697
Fx: 772-569-2955

Dana Safety
3810-A W. Hillsborough Ave
Tampa, FL 33614
Ph: 813-348-4866
Fx: 813-375-8347

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award Sandi White Gail Walker-Keen Mark Sevigny
Three (3) Annual Renewals sandi.white@gtdist.com ail@lawmans.net msevigny@1dss.com
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
|item Number DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: HI GLOSS
HI GLOSS GLOVE POUCH
10972 |SAFARILAND® SURGICAL GOLVE POUCH 33-9V Sl NOBIR NO BID
HI GLOSS RADIO HOLDER ’
10973 |pUTYMAN™ 4131 CLARINO FINISH 4131 $18.71 HOBIE NQ BID
10973  |HI GLOSS RADIO HOLDER (Would replace Dutyman) }
(Promrved | SAFARILAND® RADIO CARRIER 763-9 $30.33 NO BID NO BID
HI GLOSS BELT KEEPER
10974 |SAFARILAND® BELT KEEPER 2-Snap (4-pk) 62-4-9HS $24.88 NO BID NOBID
HI GLOSS CUFF CASE
10975 |SAFARILAND® HANDCUFF POUCH TOP FLAP 190-9HS S NOBID NO BID
HI GLOSS OC FOAM HOLDER
10977 |SAFARILAND® MACE HOLDER TOP FLAP 38-4-9HS $30.33 NOEBID NO BID
HI GLOSS DOUBLE MAG HOLDER
11378 |SAFARILAND® DOUBLE MAG POUCH 77-76-9HS §35.05 NG BID NOBID
HI GLOSS BELT
VARIOUS |SAFARILAND® HI GLOSS BELT WITH BRASS BUCKLE $60 87 NO BID NO BID
875-(SIZE) -9B
\Holster - Glock 45/9mm pistol, Hi Gloss, Vertical Belt Lp
11874 |SAFARILAND® W/ LIGHT - RH 7360-28327-491-MS30 $139.98 NO BID NO BID
Holster - Glock 45/9mm pistol, Hi Gloss, Vertical Belt Lp
11875 |SAFARILAND® W/ LIGHT - LH 7360-28327-492-MS30 $139.98 HOIBID NOBID
Time for Delivery ARO 60 Days N/A N/A
Exceptions None None None

* BW Duty Belt - No Award Buyer Rev 8.18.20 (pg 4)
* CO#1 - Dana Safety non-renewed on the 1st renewal, awarded to GT, with the addition of new Taser Holster awarded to GT 7/14/2020
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Donna Farnham, Warehouse Manager

Supply Distribution Bureau
(813) 247-8948

BID NUMBER:

Bid 9-19 Duty Gear

Opened: July 16, 2019
Awarded: July 30, 2019

1st Renewal Exp: July 29, 2021
2nd Renewal Exp: July 29, 2022

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award
Three (3) Annual Renewals
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

GT Distributors, Inc.
2545 Brockton Drive Ste 100
Austin, TX 78758
Ph: 800-252-8310
Fx: 800-480-5845

Sandi White
sandi.white@gtdist.com

Lawmen's & Shooters Supply
7750 9th Street SW
Vero Beach, FL 32968
Ph: 800-562-5697
Fx: 772-569-2955

Gail Walker-Keen
gail@lawmans.net

Dana Safety
3810-A W. Hillsborough Ave
Tampa, FL 33614
Ph: 813-348-4866
Fx: 813-375-8347

Mark Sevigny
msevigny@1dss.com

Nl'::":er DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: PADDLE HOLSTER AND OTHER ITEMS
ALS CONCEALMENT BELT LOOP & PADDLE, BIKINI TOP ]
11870 |SAFARILAND® WITH LIGHT - RH 7378-28327-411 $44.70 HOBID NOBID
ALS CONCEALMENT BELT LOOP & PADDLE, BIKINI TOP
1871 |SAFARILAND® WITH LIGHT - LH 7378-28327-412 $44:70 NOBID NO BID
COMPACT TACTICAL WEAPON - MOUNTED LIGHT .
78 ([ o o TCAMEa0 LS $79.55 $86.94 / min 10 $77.75
Time for Delivery ARO 60 Days 30-45 Days 30 Days
Exceptions None None None

* BW Duty Belt - No Award

Buyer Rev 8.18.20 (pg 4)

* CO#1 - Dana Safety non-renewed on the 1st renewal, awarded to GT, with the addition of new Taser Holster awarded to GT 7/14/2020



