2023\0- 00225

CHAD CHRONISTER, SHERIFF INTER-OFFICE
Hillsborough County MEMORANDUM
Tampa, Florida

DATE: June 11, 2024

TO: William V. Spinelli, CFO

Financial Services Division

FROM: Bryan Chandler, Buyer ﬁ’( /
Financial Services Division

RE: Bid 2023-029 Duty Gear and Related Equipment
Change Order #1

MESSAGE:

This change order is respectfully being submitted to request the addition of the Galls
brand Sam Browne Style belt as an item to this bid. The original belt awarded, the Acker belt,
has been experiencing excessive lead times, which has caused delays in fulfilling our supply
needed for Deputies.

Given the critical nature of timely duty gear provisioning for our Supply Distribution
Section, it is imperative that we have an alternative that meets our specifications and can be
delivered within a reasonable timeframe. The Galls brand Sam Browne Style Belt is a suitable
alternative that can fulfill our requirements promptly. Additionally, the Galls belt is available at a
lower cost compared to the Acker belt.

After a thorough review, I recommend that we amend bid 2023-029 to include the Galls
brand Sam Brown belt. This change will add item numbers 57 through 74 to the tabulation sheet
included for your review.

Thank you for your consideration in this matter.

APPROVED DISAPPROVED ACK DATE §AME ABN TITLE
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~ SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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' Bid Tabulation
BryanCHANDLER FINANGIAL SERVICES DIVISION
Buver ORENTROAD WAREHOUSE
(513) 247-§957  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.coM
BID 2023-029 Duty Gear And Related Equipment SI-300510 SI-233855 SI-14672 SI1-256337 SI-300908 SI-254386
Opened: January 2,2024 ) Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.
&n!nnd@d.'{'Mm‘ldng.'Fehmw 12,2024 18530 Mack Ave 3810 W. Osborne Ave. 701 Columbia Blvd. 1124 New Meister LN. STE. 100 20701 Nordhoff Street 1340 Russell Cave Rd.
|Initial Term Expires: February 12,2025 Grosse Painte Farms, MI. 48236 Tampa, FL. 33614 Titusville, FL. 32780 Pflugerville, TX. 78660 Chatsworth, CA. 91311 Lexington, KY. 40505
Change Order# 1: June 10, 2024
Renewal 1 Expires:
Renewal 2 Expires: Matthew Bell Kevin Brennan Orlando Rioseco David Curtis Ameer Nouh John Perkins
Renewal 3 Expires:
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 800-330-6422 813-348-4866 321-360-3033 512-451-8298 818-341-1500 844-464-2557
Three (3) Annual Renewals mattb@icopsplus.com kbrennan(ii/danasafety.com oriosecalillawmens.net hidu@utdist com bidsf@iuniformw.com perkins-jchn@galls.com
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA IND!CATES-J\W&RB]
DESCRIPITION iy Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
1 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 26 00290 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid 35 1_90_
2 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5z 28 00291 §75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $52.50
3 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5z 30 00292 $75.28 $55.08 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $52.50
4 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Bashetweave - 5z 32 00293 $75.28 $55.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $52.50
5 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 34 00294 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $52.50
6 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5z 36 00295 §75.28 £59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid 0 _552 5_¢ L
7 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 38 00296 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid $£52,50
8 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 40 00297 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid 552_<0
9 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 42 00298 §75.28 $59.98 $38.60 No Bid No Bid §52.50 |
10 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 44 00299 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid i $52.50 [
11 Alker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 46 00300 £75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid I
12 |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 48 00301 $75.28 $59.98 $88.60 No Bid No Bid
13 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 50 00302 $86.58 $65.97 $97.40 No Bid No Bid
14 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 52 00303 $86.58 $65.97 $97.40 No Bid No Bid
15 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 54 00304 $86.58 $65.97 $99.80 No Bid No Bid
16 Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 56 00305 $86.58 £68.97 $99.80 No Bid No Bid -I
17  |Aker Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 58 00306 $86.58 $68.97 $106.50 No Bid No Bid :|
18 |Aker Sam Brawne Duty Belt Modet BOTBasketweave - Sz 60 00307 $86.58 $68.97 $106.50 No Bid No Bid 0l
19 |ASP Baton Holder Sidebreak - Rotating Scabbard 21-Black 00087 $42.71 $47.31 $37.20 $40.91 $54.50
20 Bianchi Model 7906 P/N 22091 Basketweave Belt 00289 $11.31 No Bid $10.87 $12.05 No Bid No Bid
Keeptrs [4-PK) : b= '
21 Eleven 10 Model E10-3021B-BSK Basketweave C- 00667 |
AT Tourniauet Holder - Bleck . $26.72 - $26.99 $32.75 $32.89 $38.50 29.25
22 |Bianchi Model 7900 P/N 22063 Basketweave Cuff 00308 i i i
Case $23.34 No Bid $22.42 _ $24.85 No Bid No Bid
23 Bianchi Mode! 7902 P/N 25341 Basketweave Double Mag Case 00313 £29.93 No Bid in) ;1&75 i $31.87 No Bid No Bid
24 Hero's Pride Model 1473W Basketweave Light 00084 s : H
Holder - Will it Streamlight Stripn _ $11.07 511.31 No Bid No Bid $15.50 12.82
25 | Bianchi Mode! 7928 P/N 22962 Basketweave 00309 ; B S1690 i i
e Ciae “ $17.62 No Bid I 5,“_@0 $18.76 No Bid No Bid
26 Biachi Model 7907 P/N 22103 Basketweave OC 00310 H ; i 1
ey $22.77 No Bid $21.87 $24.24 No Bid No Bid
27  |Streamlight Compact Tactical Weapon-Mounted 00913 $128.50 $110.75 $119.00 $121.20 $152.50 $109. 50
Light TLR-7, . = d - - S
28 [Safariland Model 7634 Basketweave Radio Carrier 00086 $24.92 No Bid [ maa &l $26.52 No Bid No Bid
29 |Defensive Baton - ASP Baton F21EF #52413 00017 $123.91 $119.86 $120.00 $118.69 $149.50 $106.20
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Bid Tabulation

Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC, Galls LLC.
30 |Handcufis (Peerless Model #700) 00078 $22.66 $27.25 $24.75 $24.88 $28.50 $24.75
31 (S:-t:;land Model 62-4-9HS Hi Gloss Belt Keepers 00361 §23.78 No Bid §22.85 $25.30 No Bid No Bid
32 Safariland Model 190-9HS Hi Gloss Cuff Case 00362 $34.36 No Bid $33.60 36.59 No Bid No Bid
33 |Safariland Model 77-76-9HS Hi Gloss Double Mag Case 00374 $34.93 No Bid 3425 $37.20 No Bid No Bid
34 |Safariland Model 763-9 Hi Gloss Radio Carrier 00360 $29.50 Ne Bid 52850 $31.40 No Bid No Bid
35 |Safariland Model 33-9V Hi Gloss Glove Case 00359 $24.19 No Bid $23.25 - $25.76 No Bid No Bid
36 Safariland Model 38-4-9HS Hi Gloss OC Foam . : :
Holder 00363 $20.50 No Bid $28.50 $31.40 No Bid No Bid
37 LawPro Sam Browne Belt Buckle - Gold 00489 $6.33 $6.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.30
38 |Leg Irons (Peertess Mode! #703C) 00130 $43.21 $49.50 $43.57 $45.85 $50.50 $45.60
39 |OC Pepper Gel - Sabre Red Crossfire MK-3 Gel 00284 $10.24 $10.90 $14.00 No Bid $15.50 $15.27
40 |Plastic Flex Cuffs - Monadnock #3220-3-2B Black 00318 $178.94 Per 100 No Bid §106.25 Case $198.41 Case No Bid $225.75 Case
41 Quick Release Halster System 00639 . . .
Sufariland OuickeKit 1 19 & 22) Black $19.48 No Bid $37.45 $20.73 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7378-28327-412; Safariland 7378 7TS B
42 ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Combo, Plain Black, Glock 00762 $48.67 No Bid $£46,78 $51.83 No Bid No Bid
45, TLR-7, LH .
Holster - 7378-28327-411; Safariland 7378 7TS
43 ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Comba, Plain Black, Glock 00761 $48.67 No Bid 346.75 $51.83 No Bid No Bid
45. TLR-7, RH
Holster - 7360-28327-412; Safariland 7360 7TS
44 ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45, Verticai Belt Loop, TLR 00782 $119.00 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
7.LH
Holster - 7360-28327-482; Safariland 7360 7TS
45 ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45, Vertical Belt 00760 $119.00 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Loop, TLR-7.LH
Holster - 7360-28327-492; Safariland 7360 7TS
46 | ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Hi Gloss, Glock 45, Verticat Belt Loop, 00771 $133.00 No Bid $142.75 $140.18 No Bid No Bid
TLR-7.LH
Holster - 7360-28327-411; Safariland 7360 7TS
47 ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, TLR 00781 £119.00 No Bid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
7.RH
Holster - 7360-28327-481; Safariland 7360 7TS
48 ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock 45, Vertical Belt 00759 $119.00 NoBid $127.50 $125.43 No Bid No Bid
Loop, TLR-7. RH
Holster - 7360-28327-491; Safariland 7360 7TTS
49 ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Hi Gloss, Glock 45, Vertical Belt Loop, 00770 $133.00 No Bid $142.75 $140.18 No Bid Na Bid
TLR-?, RH —
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-481; Safariland
50  |7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock New Item 02129 $132.69 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
45MOS, 5097, TLR-7, RH
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-482; Safariland
51 [7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Black Basketweave, Glock New Item 02130 $132.69 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
A5SMOS, S09T, TLR-7, LH =
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-411; Saferiland
52 |7360RDS TTS ALS/SLS Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45MOS, New Item 02131 $132.69 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
5097, TLR-7. RH ———— =
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-412; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS
53 |Mid-Ride, Plain Black, Glock 45SMOS, 509T, TLR-7, LH New item 02132 $132.69 No Bid $142.75 $139.85 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7360RDS-28327-491; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS =
54 |Mid-Ride, Black Hi- Gloss, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, RH New item 02135 £146.69 No Bid $157.20 $154.60 No Bid No Bid
i Holster - 7360RDS-28327-492; Safariland 7360RDS 7TS ALS/SLS _ -
55  |Mid-Ride, Black Hi- Gloss, Glock 45MOS, 509T, TLR-7, LH New item 02136 $146.69 No Bid $157.20 $154.60 No Bid No Bid
Holster - 7378RDS-28327-412; Safariland -
7378RDS 7TS ALS Concealment Paddle & Belt Loop Combo, Plain | New Item 02133- . . .
6 ,
5 Black, Glock 45MOS, 509-T, RH 02134.LH $83.61 No Bid ; 580,15 $88.87 No Bid No Bid
Delivery Davs 45-60 Days 30-60 Days 30-60 Days 60 Days 20 Days 30 Days
|Exceptions No Min Order No Min Order No Min Order
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Proposed
Bid Tabulation

Courage Tactical (Cops Plus) Dana Safety Lawmen's And Shooter's Supply GT Distributors INC. Uniform Warehouse INC. Galls LLC.

Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 26 $43.00
ik Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5z 28 343.00
£ Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 30 $43.00
= Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 32 $£43.00
60 Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 34 I$43.00
o Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 52 36 B ?300—
& Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5z 38 $43.00
. Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BOI  Basketweave - Sz 40 $43.00 |
_ Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 ~ Basketweave - Sz 42 R $43.00 :
e Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO!  Basketweave - Sz 44 $43.00
« Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Bett Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 46 -§43.00
a Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 48 $43,00
= Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - Sz 50 35300
& Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1  Basketweave - Sz 52 5;:3;])_
2 Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketweave - Sz 54 $43.00
= Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Made! BO1Basketweave - Sz 56 : r $4300 -|
2 Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1 Basketweave - 5258 : $43.00 -!l
:: Gall's Brand Sam Browne Duty Belt Model BO1Basketwesve - Sz 60 $43.00 II

Change Order#1 Added Gall's Brand Sam Brown Duty Belt



Customer:

LLS

Date: 05/29/2024

Quote

(5417999) HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY SHERIFF

Page 1 of 1
Quote Number: 26708799

Sales Rep: CHLOE BANKS Quote Expiration: 06/28/2024

Sold To: Ship To:

HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY SHERIFF HILLSBOROUGH CNTY JAIL

PO BOX 3371 1201 ORIENT RD

TAMPA, FL 33601-3371 TAMPA, FL 33619

DONNA FARNHAM DONNA FARNHAM

) Qs ‘ Your

Line|Item Desgcription Qty | Retail| pric Ext Tota

1 LP145 BW BRS 42 GALLS GEAR SAM BROWNE BELT 1 43,00 43.00

Quote is valid for 30 days SUBTOTAL: 43.00
SHIPPING:

Galls is required to collect sales tax on shipments to certain states. Sales tax will TAX.....:

be added where applicable. For tax exempt customers, state laws require us to have TOTAL 43.00

signed tax exemption or resale certificates on file at our office. If you are tax
exempt, please email or fax this information, (including your Galls account number)

to Tax@galls.com or fax 859-268-5946.

Export Restrictions - This may contain commodities restricted in the United States

International Trade Regulations.

1340 Russell Cave Rd
Lexington, KY 40505

Tel: 800-876-4242

Fax:877-914-2557




Galls, LLC Invoice Credit Terms and Conditions of Sale

Payment - Invoices for items delivered pursuant to any sales order are payable only in
United States currency. You, your business, and/or your agency (the "Buyer") understand
that Galls, LLC {(the "Seller") may impose and charge a finance charge that is the greater
of 1.5% per month or the highest rate allowed by law on any amount which becomes past due
and delinquent. Returned checks may be assessed a $25.00 service fee. Additiomally,
Buyer shall be responsible for all collection costs, court costs, and reasonable
attorney's fees in connection with the recovery of delinquent amounts.

All sales are made pursuant to these Credit Terms and Conditions of Sale, and Seller
objects to any different or additional terms or conditions contained in Buyer's purchase
order or any other document submitted by Seller. Payments may be applied against open
balances at the sole discretion of Seller and may be applied across accounts if Buyer has
more than one account with Seller. Credit memos are non-refundable and may be applied to
open invoices at Seller's sole discretion.

Credit Terms - Any extension of credit is based upon all amounts payable on or before the
due date on any written, quoted, or agreed terms, and shall be paid in accordance with
such terms. If not paid on or before such date, accounts shall be considered delinquent
and subject to the additional finance charges as set forth herein.

Buyer agrees to provide Seller, upon request, with an updated credit application as a
condition to the continued extension of credit. Buyer acknowledges and agrees that Seller
may utilize outside credit reporting services and financial institutions to obtain
information on the Buyer as a condition precedent to or for continued extension of
credit. Seller may terminate any credit availability within its sole discretion and
without prior notice. Buyer's continued solvency is a precondition to any sale made by
Seller.

Delays - Where a specific shipping date is not designated on the face hereof or in a
subsequent writing signed by the Seller, the Seller shall not be responsible for any
delays, nor shall Seller be liable for any loss or damages resulting from such delays.
geller shall not be liable for any delays in filling thisg order caused by accidents to
machinery, differences with employees, strikes, labor shortage, fire, floods, priorities
requested or required by an instrumentality of the United States Government or the
government of any state, delays in transportation, restrictions imposed by any federal,
state or municipal law or regulation, whether valid or invalid, or causes beyond the
control of the Seller.

Warranty - Seller shall pass through to Buyer all manufacturer warranties and return
policies applicable to Buyer's order. Seller shall take all reasonable actions to ensure
that Buyer receives the benefit of such pass through warranties and return policies.
Buyer's sole remedies for any goods sold hereunder shall be as provided in such
warranties and return policies and shall be solely against the applicable manufacturer.
SELLER, ON BEHALF OF ITSELF, DISCLAIMS ALL WARRANTIES, WHETHER EXPRESS, IMPLIED, OR
STATUTORY, RELATING TO SUCH GOODS.

Restocking - If a cancellation of an order or a return by Buyer is accepted or initiated
by Seller and/or the manufacturer, it may be subject to a restocking charge at the
discretion of Seller.

Delivery and Transportation - Products sold herein are sold FOB at the place indicated on
the face of this sales order unless otherwise agreed to in writing by Seller and Buyer.
The method and agency of transportation and the routing will be designated by the Seller.
In the event the Buyer requests alternative shipment or routing, all extra packing,
shipping and transportation charges thereby resulting will be for the Buyer's account.

Waiver - No provision herein shall be deemed a waiver by reason of any previous waiver,
and no breach of any provision shall be deemed a waiver by reason of any previous breach.

Governing Law - The sole jurisdiction and venue shall be the courts of the Commonwealth
of Kentucky.

Export Restrictions - This transaction may contain commodities restricted in the United
States International Trade Regulations. If at a later date the Buyer decides these
commodities will be exported from the United States please reference the United States
Department of Commerce Bureau of Industry and Security Export Administration Regulations
(15 CFR 730-774), the United States Department of State International Traffic in Arms
Regulations (22 CFR 120-130) as well as any other applicable laws. These laws apply to
private, commercial, and government agency export transactions. As an exporter, the Buyer
will be responsible for compliance with all U.S. laws relating to the export of these
items.

*Designates this item is on the Galls GSA Contract (47QSWA21D008H) all other items are
OPEN MARKET.



