
Initial Tab Sheet

TC NUMBER: 2024-031 HCSO Supplier SI-26056 HCSO Supplier SI-234382 HCSO Supplier SI-15073 HCSO Supplier SI-14672 HCSO Supplier SI-141122

Opened: February 7, 2025 Evident, INC. Tri Tech Forensics Lynn Peavey Company Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. Arrowhead Forensics
Initial Award: March 25, 2025 739 Brooks Mill Rd 3811 International Blvd. #100 11042 Strang Line Rd. 701 Columbia Blvd 11006 Strang Line Road
Exp Date: March 25, 2028 Union Hall, VA 24176 Leland, NC. 28451 Lenexa, KS. 66215 Titusville, FL 32780 Lenexa, KS 66215
Auto Renewal 1 EXP: March 25, 2030 #3 #6 #4 #2 #5
Auto Renewal 2 EXP: March 25, 2032
Auto Renewal 3 EXP: March 25, 2034 Ruth Prillaman Amanda Harper Mana Muniz Orlando Rioseco Brianna McCreary

(800)576-7606 (910) 480-1845 (913) 4956642 (321) 360-3033 (913) 945-1841
Terms: Three (3) Years Initial Award procure@shopevident.com gkinlaw@tritechusa.com mmuniz@peaveycorp.com Orioseco@lamens.net bmccreary@arrowheadforensics.com
Optional: Three (3), Two (2) Year Renewals

A      
00588

$5.50ea Viper Fiberglass Brush                                                  
Evident Item# 1105

$6.12ea                                                          
Item# BR-FG-7.25

$7.00ea                                                         
Item# 05539

$10.50ea Zephyr Fiberglass Brush                                       
Forensic Source Item# 1-0200

$10.00ea                                                    
Arrowhead Cyclone Brush Item# A-

2488

B      
00064

$28.00ea                                                    
Evident Item# 9001

$23.95ea                                                      
Item# CK-LPC2T (HCSO)

$25.45ea                                                        
Item# 09525                                                       

Min. Order 48Kits

$144.00ea                                                      
Forensic Source Item# 1-0135

$33.50ea                                               
Arrowhead Chief Kit Item# A-2206-

HCSO

C    
00136

$12.00ea                                                     
Evident Item# 441

$9.68ea                                                          
Item# PAD-TTI-1.5

$9.00ea                                                            
Item# 30054

$10.05ea                                                       
Sirchie Item# PFP601

$10.70ea                                                                     
Arrowhead Item# A-2527P

D    
00180

$16.00ea                                                   
Evident Item# 8011

$10.96ea                                                       
Item# TOWINK

13.32ea                                                               
Item# 05580

$15.10ea                                                       
Sirchie Item# FPT1C

$16.32ea                                                                      
Arrowhead Item# A-2515

E    
00269

$6.00                                                            
Evident Item# 2001B

3.24ea                                                   
Item#TAPE-TT-1.5

$6.25ea                                                         
Item# 05563

$7.75ea                                                         
Sirchie Item# 144L $6.50ea Arrowhead Item#

F    
00676

$7.00ea                                                           
Evident Item# 2003B

$12.22ea                                              
Item#TAPE-FT-2 No Bid $8.74ea                                                          

Sirchie Item# 145L2 No Bid

Crime Scene and Fingerprinting Supplies

Fingerprint Lifting Tape
Clear lift tape, 1 1/2" x  360" roll 
in a plastic container and/or jar

Fingerprint Lifting Tape
Frosted lift tape, 2" x  360" roll 
in a plastic container and/or jar

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Fingerprint Brush 
Fiberglass filament fingerprint 
brush

Fingerprint Kit
Field kit for latent fingerprint 
collection
In hard plastic carrying case 

Fingerprint Pad
Stain-free ink, permanent and non-
fading, instantly drying, 0.5 ounce, 
1 5/8" diameter case

Fingerprint Ink Remover 
Towelettes 100 Towelettes per 
box
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G    
00267

$15.00ea                                                         
Evident Item# 4013-NB

$15.54ea                                                         
Item# TTF-BT-SL

$20.50ea                                                       
Item# 5617

$22.50ea                                                    
Forensic Source Item# 3-5013

$16.93ea                                                   
Arrowhead Item# A-6102

H    
00245

$25.00ea 12 Tubes                                      
Evident Item# 4026

$41.76ea CS of 12                               
Item#ECT2 No Bid $30.75ea                                                          

Sirchie Item# ECT2
$21.15ea 12 Tubes per Pack                    
Arrowhead Item# A-19120

I       
00246

$25.00ea 6 Tubes                                              
Evident Item# 4072

$41.00ea CS of 8                                             
Item# TUBE3X12F   No Bid $44.50ea                                                        

Sirchie Item# ETC3
$39.33ea 8 Tubes per Pack                     
Arrowhead Item# A1921

J    
00268

$ 14.00ea 48 Rolls                                              
Evident Item#4001R-CSTM

$12.75ea                                                         
Item# ST-E(R&W)HCSO                               

Min. Order 40

$8.90ea                                                           
Item# 88884                                                   

Min. Order 9 rolls,                  
multiples of 3 afterwards

$22.25ea                                                        
Sirchie Item# EZ6002

$12.50ea                                                      
Arrowhead Item# A-3121S-c

K       
New 
Item

$35.00ea 100-Pack                                               
Evident Item# 5042

$29.75ea 100-Pack                                                      
Item# EB-M No Bid $69.50ea 100-Pack                                             

Forensic Source Item# 3-2051
$30.40ea Arrowhead                                         

Item# A-1193

L        
New 
Item

$39.00ea 25- Pack                                              
Evident Item# 4051

$43.16ea 25-Pack                                                        
Item# BOXG12.5

$29.52ea  20-Pack                                                    
Item 05853

$42.30ea 25-Pack                                                  
Forensic Source Item# GN-Box No Bid

M      
New 
Item

$6.00ea                                                                       
Evident Item# 2027

$4.48ea                                                                        
Item# TAPE-TP-4

$7.25ea                                                            
Item# 30036

$13.15ea 25 Sheets Per Pack                                     
Sirchie Item# PL400

$6.00ea                                                               
Arrowhead Item# A-2162

N       
New 
Item

$ 10.00ea 10-Pack                                              
Evident Item#5087G

$10.22ea 10-Pack                                                  
Item# PSP-GB No Bid $12.75ea 10-Pack                                                      

Sirchie Item# PPS401
$10.00ea                                                           

Arrowhead Item# A-6106

O       
New 
Item

$40.00ea 100 Per Pack                                    
Evident Item#503-HC

$37.22 100-Pack                                                          
Item# ENVK9X12 No Bid $126.75ea 100-Set                                                  

Sirchie Item# TVK100 No Bid

• 30 Days 30 Days 14-21 Days 30-60 Days 7-21 Days
•

Notes

Evidence Tape, Red, 108" Roll
with white, write-on strip, in 
dispenser box

Delivery ARO Number of Days

Evidence Bags 
9" x 12"  4 mil thick, self sealing, 
white write-on area with chain of 
custody, transparent, tear-off 
receipt for investigating officer, 
preprinted control number on bag.

Evidence Handgun Box
13 x 8 x 2" Preprinted area for 
recording evidence information 
and chain of possession, 
perforated holes in bottom to 
secure weapon with cable ties, 
200 lb capacity with front locking 
tabs.

Fingerprint-lift pads
4 x 6"  pre-cut transparent lifting 
tape with 3/4 inch handle 25 
sheets on each pad. 

Gray photo Evidence Scales 
6" vinyl scales 0.020" thick, 
calibrated in both inches and 
millimeters with crosshairs at each 
end.
Kraft Self-Seal Envelopes
9 1/2 x 12 1/2" Peel off paper 
strip, heavyweight 28lb.

No award made for Item O Kraft Self-Seal Envelopes

Crime Scene Tape, 1,000' Roll
Yellow and Black, 3" tape with 2" 
lettering - "Sheriff's Line - Do Not 
Cross"

Exceptions

Plastic Evidence Container
1" x 8" squared syringe transport 
tube, clear with biohazard 
markings, 0.032" wall thickness 
(minimum)

Plastic Evidence Container
3" x 12" evidence collection tube, 
clear with biohazard markings, 
0.035" wall thickness (minimum)
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