



TC NUMBER: 3-20 Janitorial Supplies Opened: 6/23/2020 Awarded: 8/25/2020 Initial Term Expires: 8/24/2021 Renewal 1 Expires: 8/24/2022 Renewal 2 Expires: Renewal 3 Expires: Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award Three (3) Annual Renewals (HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)	Simply Brakes LLC Po Box 2613 Ocala, FL 34478 simplybrakes2019@gmail.com Neil Wade 352-207-8162	Jan San Supply 6401 Badger Dr, Suite 300 Tampa, FL 33610 dan@iansansupply.bz Dan Tapia 813-626-3219	A Janitor's Closet 4183 East Hillsborough Ave Tampa, FL 33610 janitorsupplies@yahoo.com Antonio Santiago 813-626-3030	Elite Business Strategies, LLC 504 - Capital Circle SE Tallahassee, FL 32301 Princesso@myeliteproducts.com Princess Ousley 850-320-6108
ITEM NUMBER - DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:				
A. Bottle, plastic; 32 oz (10068)	NO BID	Impact Product / 503WG \$0.59 each / Qty per case 24	Impact 5032WG \$1.09 ea / Qty per case 24	PA-SB 32 \$0.71 ea
B. Bottle Sprayer, cap size 28/400 (10736)	SB Bottles \$5.93 / Qty per case 12	Amoriy 10" Tube/Blk \$3.24 ea / Qty per case 24	Tolco SPR TCHERO \$1.09 ea / Qty per case 24	PA-SHDT \$1.87 ea
C. Pump Dispenser (ounce pump) (10934)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	PA-GLP \$3.39 ea
D. 10" Wood Deck Brush, Floor Scrub (10102)	NO BID	BWK 3310 \$5.99 ea / Qty per case 12	Boardwalk 3310 \$6.77 ea / Qty per case 12	BB-DAB \$13.89 ea
E. 25" X 5" Snap on Wire Dust Mop Frame (10830)	NO BID	ABCO 2524 \$3.58 ea	Fuller Pro 29524 \$3.50 ea / Qty per case 12	DE-24F \$4.01 ea
F. Dust Mop Head 24" X 5" Swivel Snap, 4-ply yarn; Launderable (10351)	NO BID	ABCG DM - 26524B \$6.99 ea / Qty per case 12	Fuller Pro 24124 \$18.98 ea / Qty per case 12	DE-24R \$9.04 ea
G. Hand Held Plastic Dust Pan, Black, Polypropylene, No Lid, Length 12 1/4" (10146)	NO BID	Impact 700.S \$2.65 ea / Qty per case 12	Impact 710 \$3.94 ea / Qty per case 12	BB-PDP \$4.71 ea
H. Wood Handle, 60", Swivel Snap Dust Mop (10349)	NO BID	ABCO 01046-NB \$6.34 ea / Qty per case 12	Perfect 89019 \$6.58 ea / Qty per case 12	BB-THW \$4.27 ea
I. Wood Handle, Metal Threaded Push Broom, 60" (10204)	NO BID	BWK 136 01123 \$3.79 ea / Qty per case 12	Fuller Pro 7081 \$4.44 ea / Qty per case 12	BB-THMT60 \$4.57
J. Push Broom Head, 18" (10101)	NO BID	BWK 20418 \$14.52 ea	Boardwalk 20218 \$15.04 ea / Qty per case 1	BB-FBIO \$10.98 ea
K. Quick Change Side-Latch Plastic Mop Head Handle; Wood, 60", Plastic Screw Clamp; Hinged Sides (10203)	NO BID	BWK 630 \$7.79 ea / Qty per case 12	Boardwalk 605 \$8.66 ea / Qty per case 12	ME-RCPH \$25.28
L. Deck Mops Cotton, 24 oz (10348)	NO BID	BWK 124C \$7.68 ea / Qty per case 6	Abco \$11.89 ea / Qty per case 12	ME-DML \$4.88 ea
M. Mop Bucket, Down Press Combo - 35 qt., Yellow (10877)	NO BID	/ Qty per case 12	Rubbermaid FG757788 YEL \$166.97 ea / Qty per case 1	ME-DPC \$100.87
N. Mop Bucket, Funnel Type Combo with Caster, 35 qt., Yellow (11576)	NO BID	Rubbermaid 7590-88 Yel \$113.52	Rubbermaid FG759088 YEL \$137.18 ea / Qty per case 1	ME-SPC \$76.65 ea
O. Utility Brush, Tampico Fill 8 1/2" Long, Pot Scrubber (10103)	NO BID	BWK 4308 \$4.03 ea	Boardwalk 4208 \$4.89 ea	BB-SBT \$4.64 ea
P. Med Duty Scrubber, 6" X 9", Green Scouring Pad (10364)	NO BID	BWK Pad 196 \$4.99 case (\$0.25 ea) / 20 pads	Treleoni 160202 \$0.44 each / Qty per case 20	6 X 9 Green \$1.10 ea
Q. Oxygen Bleach Powder Cleanser, 21 oz (10134)	Ajax Oxygen Bleach Powder Cleanser \$4.50 ea / Qty per case 4	CPC Brand Ajax \$29.38 case (\$1.22 each) / 24 cans	Ajax \$1.51 ea / Qty per case 24	JC-AOB - Ajax \$1.43 ea
R. Stainless Steel Cleaner Towels, 30 Wipes Per Container (10131)	NO BID	ITW Stainless Steel Wipes 91930CT \$57.50 case (\$9.58 container) / 6 canisters	Weiman 92 CT \$23.67 case (\$5.92 container) / 4 canisters	MI-SSW \$70.38 case (\$11.73 container) / 6 canisters
S. Commercial Toilet Bowl Brush, White Plastic, 14 1/2" - 15" Length (10105)	NO BID	Rubbermaid REP 63100WE \$3.54 ea	Boardwalk 6217 \$5.73 ea / Qty per case 12	RA-BBH Rubbermaid \$3.26 ea
T. Insulated Foam Cups (hot/cold) (10142)	NO BID	Dart \$42.00 case (\$0.031 ea) / 1000 cups	Dart \$0.04 ea / Qty per case 1000	PP-8J8 \$38.81 case (\$0.038 ea) / 1000 cups
Delivery Days	30 Days	3 Days, except item 10736 (5 Days)	7-14 Days	2-5 Days
Exceptions	None	None	None - Response NOT Signed	Yes - COVID Shortages prevent sample. Response NOT Signed



TC NUMBER: 3-20 Janitorial Supplies Opened: 6/23/2020 Awarded: 8/25/2020 Initial Term Expires: 8/24/2021 Renewal 1 Expires: Renewal 2 Expires: Renewal 3 Expires: Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award Three (3) Annual Renewals (HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)	Imperial Bay & Paper Co. 5101 E Hanna Ave Tampa, FL 33610 tampabids@imperialdade.com Vickie Scaglione 813-623-1380	Pyramid School Products 6510 North 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610 biddept@pyramidsp.com Kenneth Miller 813-621-7688
ITEM NUMBER - DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:	NON RENEWING	
A. Bottle, plastic; 32 oz (10068)	Impact \$0.66 ea / Qty per case 96	Impact \$0.58 ea / Qty per case 96
B. Bottle Sprayer, cap size 28/400 (10736)	Contico F01066 \$0.53 ea / Qty per case 200	Continental 902BW9 \$0.52 ea / Qty per case 200
C. Pump Dispenser (ounce pump) (10934)	NO BID	Tolco 160100 \$3.25 ea / Qty per case 100
D. 10" Wood Deck Brush, Floor Scrub (10102)	ABCO 00011 \$2.52 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO 00008 \$3.21 ea / Qty per case 12
E. 24" X 5" Snap on Wire Dust Mop Frame (10830)	ABCO BH24524WF \$2.00 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO BH84524 \$2.98 ea / Qty per case 12
F. Dust Mop Head 24" X 5" Swivel Snap, 4-ply yarn; Launderable (10351)	ABCO DMTL-13524W \$3.74 ea / Qty per case 12	Better Brush 170224 \$3.69 ea / Qty per case 12
G. Hand Held Plastic Dust Pan, Black, Polypropylene, No Lid, Length 12 1/4" (10146)	ABCO Plastic Dust Pan \$1.39 ea / Qty per case 12	Rubbermaid FG2005 \$2.49 ea / Qty per case 12
H. Wood Handle, 60", Swivel Snap Dust Mop (10349)	ABCO 01406NB \$4.23 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO 01406 \$4.59 ea / Qty per case 12
I. Wood Handle, Metal Threaded Push Broom, 60" (10204)	ABCO 01104 \$2.14 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO 01104 \$2.13 ea / Qty per case 12
J. Push Broom Head, 18" (10101)	ABCO BH-11007 \$6.03 ea / Qty per case 6	Better Brush 100118 \$6.01 ea / Qty per case 12
K. Quick Change Side-Latch Plastic Mop Head Handle; Wood, 60", Plastic Screw Clamp; Hinged Sides (10203)	ABCO 01206-N8 \$7.14 ea / Qty per case 6	ABCO 0120568 \$7.05 ea / Qty per case 12
L. Deck Mops Cotton, 24 oz (10348)	ABCO CD-50032 \$3.72 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO C050016 \$3.71 ea / Qty per case 12
M. Mop Bucket, Down Press Combo - 35 qt., Yellow (10877)	ABCO T01007 \$39.63 ea / Qty per case 1	ABCO T01007 \$54.98 ea
N. Mop Bucket, Funnel Type Combo with Caster, 35 qt., Yellow (11576)	NO BID	Continental 335-39W \$62.98 ea
O. Utility Brush, Tampico Fill 8 1/2" Long, Pot Scrubber (10103)	NO BID	Better Brush Z00208 \$4.02 ea / Qty per case 12
P. Med Duty Scrubber, 6" X 9", Green Scouring Pad (10364)	Amcare S960 \$0.24 ea / Qty per case 6/10	ACS 5096 \$0.24 ea / Qty per case 60
Q. Oxygen Bleach Powder Cleanser, 21 oz (10134)	Ajax CPC14278CT \$1.18 ea / Qty per case 24	BABO P782008 \$1.36 ea / Qty per case 24
R. Stainless Steel Cleaner Towels, 30 Wipes Per Container (10131)	Scrubs 91930 \$9.32 ea per container/ Qty per case 6/30	Chase 5505 \$0.29 ea per wipe (\$8.80 container) / Qty per case 6 container 40 wipes
S. Commercial Toilet Bowl Brush, White Plastic, 14 1/2" - 15" Length (10105)	ABCO Bowl Brush 00017 \$0.74 ea / Qty per case 12	ABCO 00017 \$0.99 ea / Qty per case 12
T. Insulated Foam Cups (hot/cold) (10142)	Dart 10J10 \$27.27 case (\$0.027 ea) / Qty per case 1000	NO BID
Delivery Days	30 Days	10-14 Days
Exceptions	Minimum \$300 orders/combined items	None