
Initial Tabulation

TC NUMBER: 2024-015

Initial Award: 8/14/2024 - 8/13/2026
Change Order #: NULL
Auto Renewal 1 EXP: 8/13/2028
Auto Renewal 2 EXP: 8/13/2030
Auto Renewal 3 EXP: 8/13/2032

Terms: Two (2) Year Initial Award

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES A

Vehicle Tints
A.1 $145.00 2 HR $300.00 2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

A.2 $30.00 1 HR $75.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
A.3 $40.00 1 HR $75.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
A.4 $40.00 1 HR $75.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
A.5 $90.00 1 HR $150.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

B.1 $145.00 2 HR $350.00 2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
B.2 $30.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
B.3 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
B.4 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
B.5 $90.00 1 HR $150.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

C.1 $180.00 3 HR $450.00 3 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
C.2 $30.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
C.3 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
C.4 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
C.5 $90.00 1 HR $150.00 1 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

AVG

D.1 $180.00 3 HR $300.00 (Fewer Windows Model)
$900.00 (More Windows Model) 2-6 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

D.2 $30.00 1 HR $100.00 1-2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

D.3 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 for <19" Windows
$200.00 for >20" Windows 1-2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

D.4 $40.00 1 HR $100.00 for <19" Windows
$200.00 for >20" Windows 1-2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

D.5 $90.00 1 HR $100.00 for <19" Windows
$200.00 for >20" Windows 1-2 HR No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

LEAD LEAD LEAD LEAD LEAD

E.1 Solar Gard - Silver
$7.50

2-3
Day

→Architectural Window Films
$10.00

2
Days

Avery Dennison Products
$12.00

30
Days

3M - One Way Mirror
$6.55

21-28
Days

Llumar - Silver 20
$10.00

14
Days

E.2
Solar Gard - ARMORCOAT

$10.50 - (4 mil)
$16.50 - (8 mil)

2-3
Day

(4 mil) clear $10
(7 mil) clear $14
(8 mil) clear  $15

(14 mil) clear  $20

2
Days

Clear-Armor SL 15 (15 mil) $32.00
Clear-Armor SL31 (31 mil) $52.00

30
Days

3M - Ultra S800 (8 Mil)
$11.25

21-28
Days

Llumar - Clear (8 mil)
$13.00

14
Days

E.3 Solar Gard - Clear Frost
$8.50

2-3
Day

→Architectural Window Films
$10.00

2
Days

Avery Dennison Products
$13.00

30
Days

3M - Fasara Milky White Milano
$6.45

21-28
Days

Llumar - Frost
$13.00

14
Days

F
Solar Gard - No 

Adhesive/Plexiglass
$8.50

2-3
Day No Bid - Avery Dennison Products

$12.00
30

Days
3M - Anti-Graffiti (4 mil)

$6.15
21-28
Days No Bid -

•
→ See Buyer for Architectural 

Window Films List
→ See Buyer for Avery Dennison Films 

List
• Left Blank Left Blank N/A Exludes vehicle films $750 minimum install per day

Notes

Exceptions

Mirrored/Reflective
per square foot

Safety & Security
per square foot

Privacy/Frosted
per square foot

Cling Films - Installed
per square foot

Van Windshield Strip

Van Front Side Window

Van Rear Side Window

Van Back Window

Architectural Films

SUV New Installation
SUV Windshield Strip
SUV Front Side Window
SUV Rear Side Window
SUV Back Window

Van New Installation

Truck Windshield Strip
Truck Front Side Window
Truck Rear Side Window
Truck Back Window

Sedan New Installation
Sedan Windshield Strip
Sedan Front Side Window
Sedan Rear Side Window
Sedan Back Window

Solar Gard Magnum* Madico* Clear-Armor Security Products* 3M* Llumar*

Truck New Installation

Optional: Three (3) Bi-Annual Renewals

AUTHORIZED Avery Dennison*

(813) 293-3131  (813) 538-0872  (616) 259-8512 (407) 491-4605 (813) 249-7400
PAY VIA PURCHASE ORDER PAY VIA P-CARD PAY VIA PURCHASE ORDER PAY VIA PURCHASE ORDER PAY VIA PURCHASE ORDER

Randy Rodriguez Luis Tapia Mario Martin Sara Syverson Mike Castelli
GlassAct@aol.com arecomsolar@gmail.com martin@clear-armor.com sara.syverson@ngs.inc mikec@solartekwindowtinting.com

Opened: July 18, 2024 3:00pm EST Glass Act Performance Auto Group LLC Clear-Armor LLC DBA NGS Films and Graphics Solar Tek Window Tinting Inc
3334 Pendleton Way 3012 North 38th Street 32991 North Thornapple Lane 140 Mountain Brook Drive 3853 Northdale Boulevard STE 111

Land O Lakes, Florida 34639 Tampa, Florida 33605 Grayslake, Illinois 60030 Canton, Georgia 30115 Tampa, Florida 33624

Window Films National Glazing Solutions LLC
HCSO Supplier SI-216273 HCSO Supplier SI-254422 HCSO Supplier SI-301128 HCSO Supplier SI-301130 HCSO Supplier SI-301130
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