
Family Ford, Inc Tampa-F LLC
Bill Currie Ford DBA: Brandon Ford DBA: Elder Ford of Tampa

7/28/2025
7/28/2028 5815 N. Dale Mabry Hwy 9090 Adamo Dr. 9560 Florida Ave. 

Tampa, FL 33614 Tampa, FL 33619 Tampa, FL 33612
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: Jason R. Binder Matt Cullen Brian Zeigler

(813) 554-5337 (813) 246-3673 407-468-8417
jbinder@billcurrieford.com mcullen@brandonford.com bzeigler@elderfordoftampa.com

Item Amount / % Amount / % Amount / %

A.1 $95.60 $185.00 $175.00 

A.2 $34.99 $99.95 $69.95

A.3 $43.15 $25.00 $20.00

A.4 $21.58 $49.95 $25.00

A.5 $21.58 $22.50 $15.00

A.6 $35.96 $25.00 $30.00

A.7 $85.60 $199.95 $175.00

A.8 $119.95 $199.95 $89.95

A.9 $89.95 $169.95 $89.95

A.10 $85.60 $199.95 $175.00

A.11 $12.99 NO BID $3.00

B.1 9.50% 10.00% 30.00%

C.1 Same Day/Next Day 90 Minutes Normally Same Day

C.2 Same Day/Next Day 90 Minutes Normally Same Day

•

Labor – Wiper Blade Installation

Parts Pricing – Percentage Over Cost

BID NUMBER: 2025-010
Vehicle Repair Services

Optional: Three (3) / Two (2) Years Renewals

Opened: May 20, 2025

Terms: Three (3) Years Initial Award
Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP: 

Initial Award: 
Initial Award EXP:

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Labor – Battery Replacement

Labor – ECM/BCM Flash

Labor – Four Wheel Alignment

Labor – Air Conditioning Charge 

Description

Labor – Repairs 

SMI Flat Rate 
(up to 7 qts of Oil, Filters, Fluids, Inspection)

Labor – Tire Mount/Dismount 
(Includes valve stem replacement)

Labor – Tire Repair

Labor – Tire Balance

Labor – Two Wheel Alignment

Exceptions or Additional work or changes 

Estimated time for delivery for Parts

Estimated time for delivery for Tires
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•

Labor – Wiper Blade Installation

Parts Pricing – Percentage Over Cost

BID NUMBER: 2025-010
Vehicle Repair Services

Optional: Three (3) / Two (2) Years Renewals

Opened: May 20, 2025

Terms: Three (3) Years Initial Award
Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP: 

Initial Award: 
Initial Award EXP:

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Labor – Battery Replacement

Labor – ECM/BCM Flash

Labor – Four Wheel Alignment

Labor – Air Conditioning Charge 

Description

Labor – Repairs 

SMI Flat Rate 
(up to 7 qts of Oil, Filters, Fluids, Inspection)

Labor – Tire Mount/Dismount 
(Includes valve stem replacement)

Labor – Tire Repair

Labor – Tire Balance

Labor – Two Wheel Alignment

Exceptions or Additional work or changes 

Estimated time for delivery for Parts

Estimated time for delivery for Tires

Tampa F Automotive The Elite
Management LLC Total Car Care Inc Take 5 Oil Change
DBA: Gator Ford

611 W. Robertson St. 400 S. Church St #700
11780 Tampa Gateway Blvd. Brandon, FL 33511 Charlotte, NC 28202

Seffner, FL 33584
David Leatherman Shannon Long Lindsey Osborne

(813) 980-3673 (813) 689-7171 (980) 259-3517
dleatherman@gatorford.com shannon@theelitetotalcarcare.com Lindsey.Osborne@drivenbrands.com

Amount / % Amount / % Amount / %

$159.95 $75.00 NO BID

$95.00 $64.95 $71.00 Full Synthetic Premium 

$29.95 $15.00 NO BID

$29.95 $10.00 NO BID

$59.95 $15.00 NO BID

$69.95 $30.00 NO BID

$159.95 $125.00 NO BID

$129.95 $55.00 NO BID

$99.95 $55.00 NO BID

$159.95 $125.00 Air Filters 30% Off ($24.49-$41.99)

$11.95 $5.95 Wiper Blades 30% Off ($13.99 stan. / $22.99 prem.)

35.00% 8.00% NO BID

ASAP Same Day NO BID

ASAP 2 HRS NO BID

* The Elite Total Car Care additional Info and Cost: 
A.3 - Plus Cost of TPMS STEM @ Cost+ 8%.
A.5 - Tire Combo Mount/Dismount and Balance $25.00
A.7 - Labor only for Flash, Plus Cost of Flash + 8% (Each Manufaturer Flash Cost is Different)
A.10 - R134 Evacuate and Recharge is $75.00 Plus Cost of Freon + 8% - All Newer vehicles require 1234YF Different Machine takes longer-Freon Cost + 8%.
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