= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE

2008 EasT EBCHTH AVENLE
Tanpa, FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryAN CHANDLER

BUYER

(515) 247- 5065 BCHANDILER@TEAMHCSO.com

Initial

BID NUMBER: 2025-008

Paper Goods and Accessories

Opened: August 7, 2025

Initial Award: November 5, 2025

Initial Award Time: 9:00AM

Expiration Date: November 5, 2028
Change Order#1:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Years from Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Two Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-301113

All Florida Paper
9150 NW 105th Way
Medley, Florida 33178

Mario Vale
(305) 755-4820
mvale@allfloridapaper.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301596

Florida Cleaning Products
1640 Mason Avenue
Daytona Beach, Florida 32117

Maria Porton
(386)944-6552

bids@myfscp.com

HCSO Supplier SI-15086

Imperial Dade
4522 East Wetherbee Road
Orlando, Florida 32824

Vickie Scaglione
(407) 859-1020
vscaglione@imperialdade.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301005

United Sales USA Corp.
8640 Northwest 39th Court
Coral Springs, Florida 33065

Option #1
Chaya Goldstein
(321) 636-3376
oaksintl79(@gmail.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Toilet Tissue

Minimum of 500 sheets per roll, no larger than
5 inches in diameter, 4-3/4 inches wide,
standard core, 2ply, white in color, 100%
recycled or virgin fiber, bulk packaging, and
individually wrapped for sanitary storage.

$28.16 per case Elite 4 x 3.5in 2ply
500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per case Min:
order 100cs SKU# PRONEW

$35.31 per case Soft Touch Elite
Premium Bath Tissue 2ply 96 rolls 500
sheets Min: order 25cs

$36.48 per case Victoria Bay 4"x3in
roll 2ply 500 sheets/roll 96 rolls/case
Min: order 250cs SKU# VBTTST4305

$41.90 per case Atlas Green Heritage
4.5"x 3.5in 2ply 500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per
case Min : order 1cs SKU# Atlas 235

Toilet Seat Covers

Biodegradable, flushable, septic-safe, 17 1/8
inches for elongated toilets, standard to fit most
public restroom dispensers, flat-pack or
interfoleded, 1 ply, minimum of 250-sheets per
package.

No Bid

$33.38 per case Empress Toilet Seat

Covers Half-fold 250pck 20packs per

case SKU# ETSC-120500 Min: order
24cs

$30.00 per case Victoria Bay Shield
White Half-Fold 5000/case Min: order
15¢s SKU# SHIELD

$34.52 per case Crystalware SaniCover
Half-Fold Toilet Seat Covers White 250
covers, 20 inner packs per case Min:
order 1cs SKU# TSCR20250

Multi-Fold Paper Towels

Unbleached natural color, 1 ply, unfolded

C |length 9.1 inches, unfolded width 10.3 inches,
folded length 9.1 inches, folded width 5.1

$18.07 per case Pro-Brands Multi-
fold towel 9.05" x 9.25" Kraft 12
packs per case Min: order 100cs

$21.65 per case Express Nova 9"x 9.45
Multifold Kraft 1ply 250 sheets per pack,
16packs/Case Min: order 28cs

$18.19 per case Victoria Bay 9.5X9in
1ply Kraft Multifold 250 Sheets/Pack
16 Packs/Case Min: order189CS SKU#

$17.50 per case Santoray 9.5" x 9.25in
Multifold Kraft 1 ply 250 sheets per pack
, 16 packs per case Min: orderlcs SKU#

) SKU#191320 SKU#Nova-MK250 VBMF91K 0430H
inches, 250 sheets per package
Roll Paper Towels
$19.89 per case Pro-Brands $19.14per case Cascades Pro Select
Hardwound roll paper towels, 1 ply, .
D |unbleached. natural color. roll leneth 350 feet Hardwound Roll Paper Towels Kraft | $21.18 per case Nova Hardwound roll Roll Paper Towel 5.3inx350ff 1ply $17.95 per case Santora
1 width > h I N g 4 inch ? 8" Roll Diameter 7.75" x 350' Min: paper towels, 1 ply, unbleached PCF Kraft 12/case Min: order 60cs 2P y
roll width 8 inches, roll diameter 5-3/4 inches, order 100cs SKU# 192180 SKU#HO035
core inside diameter
Delivery ARO 15 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Days 1-14 Days

o |Exceptions
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= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE

2008 EasT EBCHTH AVENLE
Tanpa, FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryAN CHANDLER

BUYER

(515) 247- 5065 BCHANDILER@TEAMHCSO.com

Initial

BID NUMBER: 2025-008

Paper Goods and Accessories

Opened: August 7, 2025

Initial Award: November 5, 2025

Initial Award Time: 9:00AM

Expiration Date: November 5, 2028
Change Order#1:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Years from Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Two Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-300561

Sani-Chem Cleaning Supplies
1950 Calumet Street
Clearwater, Florida 33765

Don Bailey
(727) 461-2546
orders@sani-chem.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301005

United Sales USA Corp.
8640 Northwest 39th Court
Coral Springs, Florida 33065

Option #3
Chaya Goldstein
(321) 636-3376
oaksintl79(@gmail.com

HCSO Supplier SI-300559

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, New Jersey 07036

David Freier
(908) 862-7570
orders@centralpoly.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301592

Short and Simple Supplies
13725 North 12th Street
Tampa, Florida 33613

Che' Hatcher
(813) 972-4142
sales@shortand simplesupplies.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Toilet Tissue
Minimum of 500 sheets per roll, no larger than
5 inches in diameter, 4-3/4 inches wide,

$46.30 per case Valay by Morcon 4.0"
x 3.25in roll 2ply 500 sheets 96 rolls

$48.73 per case Boardwalk 4.5"x3in

$50.00 per case Green Heritage Pro

$50.29 per case Boardwalk 4.5"x 3in 2ply

A .. . 2ply 500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per case 2ply 500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls per case 500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per case Min: order
0, .

standard core, 2ply, white in color, 100% per case Min: order 20cs SKU# Min: order 300cs SKU# BWK6180 Min: order 25cs SKU#235 les SKU# BWK6180

recycled or virgin fiber, bulk packaging, and VT2596

individually wrapped for sanitary storage.

Toilet Seat Covers

Biodegradable, flushable, septic-safe, 17 1/8 $59.83 per case Discreet Toilet Seat $10.99 per case Boardwalk Half-Fold
B inches for elongated toilets, standard to fit most Covers White Half-Fold 250/pk, No Bid $110 per case 20 packs per case Min: Toilet Seat Covers White 250/sleeve,

public restroom dispensers, flat-pack or 20pks/case No Min: order SKU# DS- order 44cs SKU# K5000 4/pack sleeve/carton Min: order lcs. SKU#

interfoleded, 1 ply, minimum of 250-sheets per 5000 BWKK1000B

package.

Multi-Fold Paper Towels b

Unbleached natural color, 1 ply, unfolded $12“3§ zegr ;gszrl\/lfinl*\s/[o ltifyll:i/[;)?;)on $36.66 per case Marcal Pro 16 packs $18.50 per case Gen 9.45"x9" Multifold
C |length 9.1 inches, unfolded width 10.3 inches, ) : A VUIOIC No Bid per case Min: order 70cs Kraft 1 ply 250 Sheet/Pack 16 Packs/Case

folded length 9.1 inches, folded width 5.1 Sheets/Pack 16 Packs/Case Min: order SKU#MFN4000 Min: order 1cs SKU# GEN1509

folde ength 9.1 inches, folded width 5. 20cs SKU# R720 :

inches, 250 sheets per package

Roll Paper Towels

$19.12 per case Morsoft by Morcon $19.10 per case Gen Hardwound Roll

Hardwound roll paper towels, 1 ply. Hardwound Roll Towels Kraft 350ft 2" $35.55 12 rolls Min: order | Paper Towels Kraft 1 ply 300ft Roll width

D |unbleached, natural color, roll length 350 feet, arawound ROt LOWe's fird No Bid ->> per case 1= rolis Min: order aper “owe’s brall | py oWl

roll width 8 inches, roll diameter 5-3/4 inches,
core inside diameter

core/ 8" 12 rolls/case Min: order 5cs
SKU# R12350

50cs SKU#P720N

8" Roll Diameter 5.75" 12 rolls per case
Min: order 1cs SKU# GEN 1804

Delivery ARO

5-7 Days

7 Days

* |Exceptions
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> HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 EasT EBCHTH AVENLE
Tanpa, FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryAN CHANDLER

BUYER

(515) 247- 5065 BCHANDILER@TEAMHCSO.com

Initial

BID NUMBER: 2025-008

Paper Goods and Accessories

Opened: August 7, 2025

Initial Award: November 5, 2025

Initial Award Time: 9:00AM

Expiration Date: November 5, 2028
Change Order#1:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Years from Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Two Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-246189

Jan San Supply INC
6401 Badger Drive
Tampa, Florida

Daniel Tapia
(813) 626-3219
dan@jansansupply.biz

HCSO Supplier SI-301005

United Sales USA Corp.
8640 Northwest 39th Court
Coral Springs, Florida 33065

Option #2
Chaya Goldstein
(321) 636-3376
oaksintl79@gmail.com

HCSO Supplier SI-

Angi Enterprises
DBA Head to Heels Safety Supplies
9021 SW 94th Street, Unit 510
Miami, Florida 33176

Subbarayan R Pochi
(305) 712-6653
cservice@headtoheels.net

HCSO Supplier SI-

Allure Hospitality Suppliers, Inc
8351 NW 64th Street
Miami, Florida 33166

Nelson Fermin
(305) 885-2484
orders@allure-hospitality.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Toilet Tissue
Minimum of 500 sheets per roll, no larger than
5 inches in diameter, 4-3/4 inches wide,

$50.36 per case Boardwalk 4.5"x3in

$59.06 per case Boardwalk 4.5"x3in

A L. 2ply 500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per case | 2ply 500 sheet/roll 96 rolls per case Min: No Samples Submitted No Samples Submitted
standard core, 2ply, white in color, 100% hl/iii: order 300cs SKU# B\IJ\)IK6180 o order 300cs SKU# B\I;/K6180 ’ ’
recycled or virgin fiber, bulk packaging, and
individually wrapped for sanitary storage.
Toilet Seat Covers
Biodegradable, flushable, septic-safe, 17 1/8 $24.65 per case Boardwalk Half-Fold
B inches for elongated toilets, standard to fit most | Toilet Seat Covers White 250/sleeve, No Bid

public restroom dispensers, flat-pack or
interfoleded, 1 ply, minimum of 250-sheets per
package.

10sleeve/carton Min: order 10cs. SKU#
BWKK2500B

Multi-Fold Paper Towels

Unbleached natural color, 1 ply, unfolded

C |length 9.1 inches, unfolded width 10.3 inches,
folded length 9.1 inches, folded width 5.1
inches, 250 sheets per package

$18.59 per case Gen 9.45"x9"
Multifold Kraft 1 ply 250 Sheet/Pack
16 Packs/Case Min: order 200cs SKU#
GEN1508

$19.06 per case Gen 9.45"x9" Multifold
Kraft 1 ply 250 Sheet/Pack 16
Packs/Case Min: order 200cs SKU#
GEN1508

Roll Paper Towels

Hardwound roll paper towels, 1 ply,

D |unbleached, natural color, roll length 350 feet,
roll width 8 inches, roll diameter 5-3/4 inches,
core inside diameter

$22.55 per case Gen Hardwound Roll
Paper Towels Kraft 1 ply 300t Roll
width 8" Roll Diameter 5.75" 12 rolls
per case Min: order 30cs SKU# GEN
1804

$22.20 per case Gen Hardwound Roll
Paper Towels Kraft 1 ply 300t Roll
width 8" Roll Diameter 5.75" 12 rolls per
case Min: order 30cs SKU# GEN 1804

Delivery ARO

8 Days

1-14 Days

* |Exceptions
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= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
= SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 EasT EBCHTH AVENLE

Tanpa, FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryAN CHANDLER

BUYER

(515) 247- 5065 BCHANDILER@TEAMHCSO.com

Initial

BID NUMBER: 2025-008

Paper Goods and Accessories

Opened: August 7, 2025

Initial Award: November 5, 2025

Initial Award Time: 9:00AM

Expiration Date: November 5, 2028
Change Order#1:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Years from Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Two Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-

Godav Investment LLC
5135 Greenwood Avenue
North Port, Florida 34287

Alexander Colina
(941) 250-2858
admin@godavglobalsupply.com

HCSO Supplier SI-

Malor & Company
3 Columbus Circle
New York, New York 10019

Garly Benoit
(212) 498-9732
garly.b@malorcompany.com

HCSO Supplier SI-13924

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, Florida 33610

Kenneth Miller
(813) 621-6446
orders@pyramidsp.com

HCSO Supplier SI-

Xsupply Solution LLC
2610 SW 54th Street
West Park, Florida 33023

Ana Mercedes Garcia Frias
(754) 320-2188
info@xsupplysolution.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Toilet Tissue

Minimum of 500 sheets per roll, no larger than
5 inches in diameter, 4-3/4 inches wide,
standard core, 2ply, white in color, 100%
recycled or virgin fiber, bulk packaging, and
individually wrapped for sanitary storage.

No Samples Submitted

No Samples Submitted

No Samples Submitted

No Samples Submitted

Toilet Seat Covers

Biodegradable, flushable, septic-safe, 17 1/8
inches for elongated toilets, standard to fit most
public restroom dispensers, flat-pack or
interfoleded, 1 ply, minimum of 250-sheets per
package.

Multi-Fold Paper Towels

Unbleached natural color, 1 ply, unfolded

C |length 9.1 inches, unfolded width 10.3 inches,
folded length 9.1 inches, folded width 5.1
inches, 250 sheets per package

Roll Paper Towels

Hardwound roll paper towels, 1 ply,

D |unbleached, natural color, roll length 350 feet,
roll width 8 inches, roll diameter 5-3/4 inches,
core inside diameter

Delivery ARO

* |Exceptions
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