P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

| Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

Instructor ltem
Cadet Item
Facilities ltem
Negotiator ltem

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 2

Purchasing Section
Jennifer Miller, Buyer
(813) 247-8068

RFP NUMBER:
27-15 Training Division & Specialty
Clothing ltems

Opened: September 25, 2015
Awarded: November 2, 2015

Law Enforcement Supply
1257-H Kennestone Cir.
Marietta, GA 30066

Ph: 800-522-8949 x4313
Fx: 770-800-9003

World Advertising of Tampa
PO Box 10129
Tampa, FL 33679

Ph: 813-760-7529
Fx: 813-835-9502

Red's Team Sports
4542 Eagle Falls Place
Tampa, FL 33619

Ph: 813-612-5999
Fx: 813-612-5996

Red the Uniform Tailor
475 Oberlin Ave. S.
Lakewood, NJ 08701

Ph: 800-272-7337
Fx: 800-701-5021

Young Guns Embroidery
143 Scarlet Blvd.
Oldsmar, FL 34677

Ph: 813-814-9172
Fx: 813-814-9407

Fast Lane Clothing Co.
5112 N. 22nd St.
Tampa, FL 33610

Ph: 813-978-3298
Fx: 813-476-0179

Galls, LLC
1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Lexington, KY 40505

Ph: 800-876-4242 x2175
Fx: 877-914-2557

Daniel Hunter Debbie Brooks Ted Koontz Krys Banker John Skiadas Ross Price Chris Graham
Terms: One Year Initial Award Zarida Garcia
Three (3) Annual Renewals dhunter@lawsupply.com worldad@msn.com (call) krys.banker@rtut.com yonski2u@aol.com ross@fastlaneclothing.com  [graham-chris@galls.com
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD)
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:
A1) BDU Pants: .
Propper F5201-38, black $27.75 No Bid $20.65 $28.65 $24.40 $25.00 $25.43
A2) BDU Pants: . .
511 TacLite Pro Pants #74273, TDU khaki $39.50 No Bid No Bid $40.20 $40.00 $41.87 $36.01
A3) BDU Pants:
Propper F5252-82 (M) / F5254-82 (F) $33.50 No Bid $26.24 $28.65 $28.90 $32.00 $30.54
Tactical Pants, khaki
A4) BDU Pants: .
Propper F5251-25, Olive $24.00 No Bid $18.24 $23.85 $20.50 $24.99 $30.54
A5) BDU Pants:
Vertx Phantom LT #VTX8000 (M) / $41.75 No Bid No Bid $42.44 $45.00 No Bid $37.15
VTX8050 (F) Tactical pants, OD Green
B) Softshell Jacket: .
Propper F5428 BA Softshell, black $95.00 No Bid $71.54 $93.45 $91.00 $81.15 $82.93
C1) Combat Shirts:
Propper TAC.U F5417-38-330, olive drab -- $55.75 No Bid $43.89 $57.45 $50.00 $49.87 $50.98
LINE ITEM NOT AWARDED--
C2) Combat Shirts: . .
Tru Spec 50/50 LS SH111, olive drab $54.50 No Bid No Bid $51.75 $48.90 $52.59 $47.91
D) Polo Shirt: %ngfi;iexﬁ;fL $17.39 size S-XL $19.39 $19.97 size S-XL $21.36
Blue Generation BG7224, red and hunter No Bid ' . size 2XL $21.39 $26.00 $17.39 $18.65 size 2XL $24.13 size
green, embroidered on left chest area SN2 D L size 3XL 3XL $26.91 size 4XL
s $21.24 size 4XL :

E1) Gold / Grey Cadet T-Shirts: $2.67 size S-XL $3.86 .
Gildan G500, stenciled with "HCSO No Bid size 2XL $4.55 size $5.79 $10.19 $3:45sze S $5.45 $3.95 $13.02
CADET" on front, rectangle on back 3XL
E2) DryFit T-Shirt (short sleeve): $9.85 size S-XL $10.85|$8.94 size S-XL $10.94
Badger Sport 4120, forest green stenciled No Bid size 2XL $11.85 size size 2XL $12.94 size $15.03 $9.50 $9.85 $18.33
on left chest area 3XL 3XL
E3) DryFit T-Shirt (long sleeve): $14.15 size S-XL $15.15 $11.54 size S-XL . g . .
Badger Sport 4104, forest green, stenciled No Bid size 2XL $16.15 size $13.54 size 2XL $19.17 $12.26 size sSiz):,\L2XL $14.56 $11.65 $22.01 size Ssi?el,:2XL $24.93
on left chest area 3XL $15.54 size 3XL
E4) Grey Facilities T-Shirt: . .

h . . $2.97 size S-XL $4.24 . $12.78 size S-XL $15.78
(Citslrn 200 Wi Cllifen, izl ze) i No Bid size 2XL $5.23 size $5.81 $10.15 $4.00 size S-XL 8575 $4.00 size 2XL $17.67 size

"FACILITIES" on right chest, HCSO star on
left chest, plain back

3XL

size 2XL

3XL-5XL
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DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS (CON'T):
Badger Sport
F) Shorts: Augusta #1420 $5.25 #7272 (m) #7278 (f) Sport-Tek #ST355 $5.99
Black, 7-9" inseam, inner liner, elastic No Bid size S-XL $6.50 size |$7.43 size S-XL $9.43 | Badger Sport #4107 $9.21 |[size S-XL $6.99 size| Badger Sport #4109 $8.25 | Champion #8731 $9.44
waist, plain, breathable non-mesh fabric 2XL $7.75 size 3XL | size 2XL $11.43 2XL
size 3XL
N $51014 4109 DriFBitadger Spor $6.43
F) Shorts (Alternate Item) N/A size S-XL $6.10 size . N N/A N/A N/A N/A
oXL $7.14 size 3XL size S-XL $8.43 size
: 2XL $10.43 size 3XL
G) Baseball Cap: )
Port Authority C833, black No Bid $3.70 $3.43 $19.95 $4.10 $4.15 $6.00
H1) Belt: . Propper #F5619-75-001 g
Black BDU style, metal buckle Tru Spec #4114 $7.00 No Bid Propper #F5619 $7.54|5.11 #59409 $31.20 $9.25 Propper #F5619-75 $8.90 |Blackhawk #41VB01 $8.33
5.11 #59551 $12.36
H2) Belt: . Propper #F5603-75-001 . 2 .
Khaki BDU style, black plastic buckle Tru Spec #4166 $8.00 No Bid Propper #F5603 $5.40 5.11 #59409 $31.20 $7.15 Propper #F5603 $6.90| size S-XL 2XL-4XL$13.97 size
H3) Military Garrison Belt: . . Boston Leather #6505-1-80
Bl e ) Eiier, @iene BusEkls Dutyman #1611 $22.50 No Bid No Bid Dutyman #1611 $19.20 $19.90 Edwards #BC00 $14.50 | Law Pro #LP6605 $9.02
H4) Belt: )
) . . $24.30 size S $25.69
Blackhawk CQB Riggers belt, desert sand $31.50 No Bid No Bid $32.95 $29.00 $28.00 size M $27.77 size L
brown
I11) Rain Jacket: . . .
Frogg Togg "Bull Frogg" #PS63172, black No Bid No Bid $26.97 $44.95 $39.95 No Bid $25.97
12) Rain Jacket: . . Frogg Togg PA63522 . Frogg Togg PA63522
Frogg Togg "Pro Action” #PA63502, black No Bid No Bid $23.97 $39.95 $39.95 No Bid $21.54
J) Campaign Hat:
Stratton F-40, felt, one-piece (non patent) No Bid No Bid No Bid $118.88 $120.00 No Bid $110.06
leather strap, forest green
#77%?d(f)r§7p;0r§ ) Augusta Gildan #G186
osi wss  [smsodmsi s SRS WSS ey [SSgRox | s
[T, LY 9 size 2XL $22.60 size . : $25.95 :
3XL-5XL
3XL
Badger Sport
) #7711 (m) #7911 (f) g Augusta Gildan #G182 $10.88
:g)l Wt‘.“m l‘.'ptP:":ts'r forest areen No Bid No Bid $17.40 size S-XL Badger Sport #7710 $30.00 ST;“; ;Egsm 0 ;:28;51 #7755 (m) #7752 (f) size S-XL $12.99 size
BRI, WS TSI g $19.40 size 2XL $21.40 : $24.95 2XL
size 3XL
Initial Digitizing - free with bid Most logos already set up. For
Initial Setup / Digitizing fees for print / N/A Free Screen _Ss_zt_up Free | award; Screen printing - $10.00 Included in price None new embrmdery $45.00 each, None
embroidery Digitizing per screen set up per job; Art new screen print $20.00 per
Creation - free with bid award screen first time only.
Business Days to Delivery ARO 15 (ltem H3 30 days) 7to 10 10 10 (Customized 30 days) 14 7t018 7 to 10 in stock
All garments: Add $2.00 for size
Iltem E1: G500 Gold & Gray must|2XL, add $4.00 for size 3XL and All garments: Pricing is for size
EXCEPTIONS None be ordered in lots of 250 (any above ltem F: 4 None None S-XL. For all add $2.00 for size None

size and color combo); 250
minimum

inseam with liner, alternate has
9" inseam & no liner (7" inseam
also available)

2XL, $3.00 size 3XL, $4.00 size
4XL, etc.




